
           
              ITEM_______ 

VILLAGE OF DOWNERS GROVE 
REPORT FOR THE VILLAGE COUNCIL WORKSHOP 

MARCH 27, 2007 AGENDA 
 

SUBJECT:                                              TYPE:                                      SUBMITTED BY: 

Bid: Supply of Traffic Sign 
Maintenance Materials 

 
 
ü 

Resolution 
Ordinance       
Motion 
Discussion Only 

David H. Barber, PE 
Director of Public Works 

 
SYNOPSIS 
A motion is requested to award contracts for the supply of traffic sign maintenance materials in an amount 
not to exceed $60,000 as follows: 
 

• Traffic control sign posts in the amount of $17,410 from Vulcan Signs of Foley, Alabama,  
• Traffic sign blanks in an amount not to exceed $22,590 from US Standard Sign of Franklin Park, 

Illinois, and 
• Traffic sign facing materials in an amount not to exceed $20,000 from the 3M Company of St. 

Paul, Minnesota. 
 
STRATEGIC PLAN ALIGNMENT 
The Five Year Plan and Goals for 2006-2011 identified Top Quality Village Infrastructure and Facilities. 
 
FISCAL IMPACT 
The adopted FY07 General Fund budget provides $60,000 for the purchase of traffic control sign posts, 
traffic sign blanks and traffic sign materials.   
 
RECOMMENDATION 
Approval on the April 3, 2007 consent agenda. 
 
BACKGROUND 
The supply of traffic sign maintenance materials was competitively bid for 2007, with 17 responses to the 
three categories of materials as detailed in the attached bid tabulations.  This purchase provides for 
approximately 1,000 sign posts and an associated variety of quantities of sign blanks and facing materials 
to be used by the Department of Public Works for sign repairs and replacements at various locations 
throughout the Village.  Traffic sign maintenance work continues throughout the year.  In 2006, United 
Rentals provided sign posts, sign blanks and some sign facing materials in the amount of $17,768.12 and 
the 3M Company provided sign facing materials in the amount of $9,038.50.  The figures for 2006 were  
only for the 8-month budget period.  Due to higher prices associated with these materials and the need for 
larger quantities of some of the materials this budget was increased for FY2007. 
   
ATTACHMENTS 
Bid tabulations 
Contract forms 



Village Council Workshop Recommendation
March 27, 2007

Traffic Control Sign Posts

# Item
Estimated 
Quantity Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost

1
Quick-Punch, Square Post 2"W x 
10'L 14 Gauge 500 25.08$       12,540.00$  26.73$       13,365.00$  27.79$       13,895.00$  31.75$       15,875.00$  32.99$       16,495.00$  

2 3' Anchor 2 1/4" 12 Gauge 500 9.74$         4,870.00$    8.58$         4,290.00$    11.47$       5,735.00$    11.30$       5,650.00$    10.96$       5,480.00$    

Total 1,000 17,410.00$  17,655.00$  19,630.00$  21,525.00$  21,975.00$  

Line Item Budget 30,000.00$  30,000.00$  30,000.00$  30,000.00$  30,000.00$  

(Over)/Under Budget 12,590.00$  12,345.00$  10,370.00$  8,475.00$    8,025.00$    

Hall Signs, Inc.

Bloomington, IN

Vulcan Signs

Foley, AL

Allied Municipal Supply

Taylorville, IL

Custom Products 
Corporation
Jackson, MS Villa Park, IL

United Rentals



Village Council Workshop Recommendation
March 27, 2007

Traffic Sign Blanks

# Item (.080 Aluminum Type 1)
Estimated 
Quantity Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost

1 12”x 6” 75 1.45$        108.75$       1.63$        122.25$         1.23$        92.25$         1.64$        123.00$       1.50$        112.50$       3.30$        247.50$       
2 18”x 6” 75 2.05$        153.75$       2.05$        153.75$         1.84$        138.00$       2.33$        174.75$       2.20$        165.00$       2.47$        185.25$       
3 24”x 6” 100 2.51$        251.00$       2.63$        263.00$         2.45$        245.00$       2.85$        285.00$       2.89$        289.00$       3.30$        330.00$       
4 30”x 6” 100 3.05$        305.00$       3.18$        318.00$         3.06$        306.00$       3.46$        346.00$       3.61$        361.00$       4.12$        412.00$       
5 36”x 6” 75 3.56$        267.00$       3.79$        284.25$         3.68$        276.00$       4.04$        303.00$       4.34$        325.50$       4.95$        371.25$       
6 42”x 6” 50 4.00$        200.00$       4.55$        227.50$         4.29$        214.50$       4.55$        227.50$       5.06$        253.00$       5.77$        288.50$       
7 24”x 8” 100 3.22$        322.00$       3.36$        336.00$         3.27$        327.00$       3.66$        366.00$       3.85$        385.00$       3.99$        399.00$       
8 24”x 9” 100 3.56$        356.00$       3.75$        375.00$         3.68$        368.00$       4.04$        404.00$       4.34$        434.00$       4.95$        495.00$       
9 30”x 9” 100 4.28$        428.00$       4.58$        458.00$         4.59$        459.00$       4.86$        486.00$       5.42$        542.00$       5.94$        594.00$       
10 36’x 9” 200 5.12$        1,024.00$    5.46$        1,092.00$      5.51$        1,102.00$    5.81$        1,162.00$    6.50$        1,300.00$    6.93$        1,386.00$    
11 42”x 9” 75 5.98$        448.50$       6.26$        469.50$         6.42$        481.50$       6.80$        510.00$       7.59$        569.25$       8.08$        606.00$       
12 48”x 9” 50 6.83$        341.50$       7.18$        359.00$         7.35$        367.50$       7.76$        388.00$       8.67$        433.50$       9.24$        462.00$       
13 24”x 10” 75 3.89$        291.75$       4.12$        309.00$         4.08$        306.00$       4.42$        331.50$       4.80$        360.00$       5.49$        411.75$       
14 9”x 12” 75 2.05$        153.75$       2.19$        164.25$         1.84$        138.00$       2.33$        174.75$       2.23$        167.25$       2.48$        186.00$       
15 24”x 12” 200 4.55$        910.00$       4.78$        956.00$         4.90$        980.00$       5.17$        1,034.00$    5.76$        1,152.00$    5.12$        1,024.00$    
16 30”x 12 150 5.83$        874.50$       5.97$        895.50$         6.13$        919.50$       6.62$        993.00$       7.23$        1,084.50$    6.40$        960.00$       
17 36”x 12” 150 6.83$        1,024.50$    7.12$        1,068.00$      7.35$        1,102.50$    7.76$        1,164.00$    8.56$        1,284.00$    7.68$        1,152.00$    
18 12”x 18” 300 3.56$        1,068.00$    3.49$        1,047.00$      3.68$        1,104.00$    4.04$        1,212.00$    4.36$        1,308.00$    3.84$        1,152.00$    
19 18”x 18” 100 5.12$        512.00$       5.42$        542.00$         5.51$        551.00$       5.81$        581.00$       6.55$        655.00$       6.51$        651.00$       
20 30”x18” 300 8.76$        2,628.00$    8.79$        2,637.00$      9.19$        2,757.00$    9.95$        2,985.00$    10.11$      3,033.00$    9.60$        2,880.00$    
21 36”x18 100 10.51$      1,051.00$    10.48$      1,048.00$      11.03$      1,103.00$    11.95$      1,195.00$    12.24$      1,224.00$    11.52$      1,152.00$    
22 18”x 24” 200 6.83$        1,366.00$    6.90$        1,380.00$      7.35$        1,470.00$    7.76$        1,552.00$    8.64$        1,728.00$    7.68$        1,536.00$    
23 24”x 24” 150 9.12$        1,368.00$    9.12$        1,368.00$      9.80$        1,470.00$    10.36$      1,554.00$    10.80$      1,620.00$    10.24$      1,536.00$    
24 36”x24” 100 13.67$      1,367.00$    13.88$      1,388.00$      14.70$      1,470.00$    15.53$      1,553.00$    16.03$      1,603.00$    15.36$      1,536.00$    
25 48”x 24” 100 18.24$      1,824.00$    18.48$      1,848.00$      19.60$      1,960.00$    20.72$      2,072.00$    21.64$      2,164.00$    20.48$      2,048.00$    
26 24”x 30” 50 11.40$      570.00$       11.36$      568.00$         12.25$      612.50$       12.95$      647.50$       13.41$      670.50$       12.80$      640.00$       
27 30”x 30” 100 14.24$      1,424.00$    14.15$      1,415.00$      15.31$      1,531.00$    16.18$      1,618.00$    16.83$      1,683.00$    16.00$      1,600.00$    
28 36”x 36” 100 20.52$      2,052.00$    20.63$      2,063.00$      22.05$      2,205.00$    23.31$      2,331.00$    24.03$      2,403.00$    23.04$      2,304.00$    
29 48”x 36 100 27.36$      2,736.00$    27.83$      2,783.00$      29.40$      2,940.00$    31.10$      3,110.00$    32.04$      3,204.00$    30.72$      3,072.00$    
30 30”x 30” Stop 200 13.49$      2,698.00$    13.23$      2,646.00$      15.31$      3,062.00$    15.32$      3,064.00$    15.14$      3,028.00$    15.51$      3,102.00$    
31 30”x 30” Yield 50 8.03$        401.50$       7.33$        366.50$         7.66$        383.00$       9.12$        456.00$       8.20$        410.00$       11.76$      588.00$       
32 30”x 30” Round 50 15.29$      764.50$       14.04$      702.00$         15.31$      765.50$       17.37$      868.50$       10.23$      511.50$       16.00$      800.00$       
33 30”x 30” School 100 14.06$      1,406.00$    13.30$      1,330.00$      15.31$      1,531.00$    15.97$      1,597.00$    14.93$      1,493.00$    16.00$      1,600.00$    
34 36”x 36” Stop 50 19.42$      971.00$       19.24$      962.00$         22.05$      1,102.50$    22.11$      1,105.50$    21.61$      1,080.50$    22.51$      1,125.50$    
35 36”x 36” Round 50 21.93$      1,096.50$    19.04$      952.00$         22.05$      1,102.50$    24.92$      1,246.00$    15.71$      785.50$       23.04$      1,152.00$    

Total 3,950 32,763.50$  32,896.50$    34,942.75$  37,220.00$  37,821.50$  37,984.75$  

Line Item Budget 18,000.00$  18,000.00$    18,000.00$  18,000.00$  18,000.00$  18,000.00$  

(Over)/Under Budget (14,763.50)$ (14,896.50)$   (16,942.75)$ (19,220.00)$ (19,821.50)$ (19,984.75)$ 

Rocal, Inc.

Frankfort, OH

Hall Signs, Inc.

Bloomington, IN

US Standard Sign

Franklin Park, IL Villa Park, IL

United RentalsVulcan Aluminum

Foley, AL

Osburn Associates, Inc.

Logan, OH



Village Council Workshop Recommendation
March 27, 2007

Traffic Sign Facing Materials

#

Item (3M Scotchlite Brand Series 
1170 - Electrocut film with clear 
liner)

Estimated 
Quantity Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost

1 36" x 10 Yard Rolls 5 85.50$      427.50$       NO BID 113.40$    567.00$         NO BID NO BID NO BID
2 36" x 50 Yard Rolls 5 427.50$    2,137.50$     607.50$    3,037.50$      477.00$    2,385.00$      526.46$    2,632.30$      555.88$    2,779.40$      549.00$    2,745.00$      
3 30" x 10 Yard Rolls 10 71.25$      712.50$       NO BID 94.50$      945.00$         NO BID NO BID NO BID
4 30" x 50 Yard Rolls 10 356.25$    3,562.50$     506.25$    5,062.50$      397.50$    3,975.00$      438.72$    4,387.20$      463.24$    4,632.40$      457.50$    4,575.00$      
5   9" x 50 Yard Rolls 5 106.88$    534.40$       151.88$    759.40$         119.25$    596.25$         131.62$    658.10$         138.98$    694.90$         137.25$    686.25$         
6 12" x 50 Yard Rolls 15 142.50$    2,137.50$     202.50$    3,037.50$      159.00$    2,385.00$      175.49$    2,632.35$      185.29$    2,779.35$      183.00$    2,745.00$      
7 24" x 50 Yard Rolls 10 285.00$    2,850.00$     405.00$    4,050.00$      318.00$    3,180.00$      350.97$    3,509.70$      370.59$    3,705.90$      366.00$    3,660.00$      
8 48" x 10 Yard Rolls 5 114.00$    570.00$       NO BID 151.20$    756.00$         NO BID NO BID NO BID
9 48" x 50 Yard Rolls 5 570.00$    2,850.00$     810.00$    4,050.00$      636.00$    3,180.00$      701.95$    3,509.75$      741.18$    3,705.90$      732.00$    3,660.00$      

#
Item (Clear Transfer Tape 3M 
#TPM5)

Estimated 
Quantity Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost

10 36" x 100 Yard Rolls 5 315.00$    1,575.00$     288.00$    1,440.00$      288.00$    1,440.00$      338.82$    1,694.10$      360.00$    1,800.00$      360.00$    1,800.00$      
11 30" x 100 Yard Rolls 15 262.50$    3,937.50$     240.00$    3,600.00$      240.00$    3,600.00$      282.35$    4,235.25$      300.00$    4,500.00$      300.00$    4,500.00$      
12 24" x 100 Yard Rolls 15 210.00$    3,150.00$     192.00$    2,880.00$      192.00$    2,880.00$      225.88$    3,388.20$      240.00$    3,600.00$      240.00$    3,600.00$      
13 18" x 100 Yard Rolls 10 157.50$    1,575.00$     144.00$    1,440.00$      144.00$    1,440.00$      169.41$    1,694.10$      180.00$    1,800.00$      180.00$    1,800.00$      
14 12" x 100 Yard Rolls 10 105.00$    1,050.00$     96.00$      960.00$         96.00$      960.00$         112.94$    1,129.40$      120.00$    1,200.00$      120.00$    1,200.00$      

#
Item (White Diamond Grade VIP 
reflective 3900 Sheeting)

Estimated 
Quantity Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost

15   9" x 50 Yard Rolls 5 534.38$    2,671.90$     450.00$    2,250.00$      500.63$    2,503.15$      509.15$    2,545.75$      548.76$    2,743.80$      562.50$    2,812.50$      
16 12" x 50 Yard Rolls 5 712.50$    3,562.50$     600.00$    3,000.00$      667.50$    3,337.50$      678.87$    3,394.35$      731.67$    3,658.35$      750.00$    3,750.00$      
17 18" x 50 Yard Rolls 5 1,068.75$  5,343.75$     900.00$    4,500.00$      1,001.25$  5,006.25$      1,018.30$  5,091.50$      1,097.50$  5,487.50$      1,125.00$  5,625.00$      
18 24" x 50 Yard Rolls 5 1,425.00$  7,125.00$     1,200.00$  6,000.00$      1,335.00$  6,675.00$      1,357.73$  6,788.65$      1,463.33$  7,316.65$      1,500.00$  7,500.00$      

#
Item (White Diamond Grade VIP 
reflective 3900 Sheeting)

Estimated 
Quantity Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost

19 30" x 50 Yard Rolls 5 1,781.25$  8,906.25$     1,500.00$  7,500.00$      1,668.75$  8,343.75$      1,697.16$  8,485.80$      1,829.17$  9,145.85$      1,875.00$  9,375.00$      
20 36" x 50 Yard Rolls 5 2,137.50$  10,687.50$   1,800.00$  9,000.00$      2,002.50$  10,012.50$     2,036.60$  10,183.00$     2,195.00$  10,975.00$     2,250.00$  11,250.00$     

#
Item (White High Intensity Prism 
3930 Sheeting)

Estimated 
Quantity Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost

21   9" x 50 Yard Rolls 10 NO BID 168.75$    1,687.50$      169.88$    1,698.80$      180.72$    1,807.20$      199.86$    1,998.60$      198.00$    1,980.00$      
22 12" x 50 Yard Rolls 15 NO BID 225.00$    3,375.00$      226.50$    3,397.50$      240.96$    3,614.40$      266.47$    3,997.05$      264.00$    3,960.00$      
23 18" x 50 Yard Rolls 15 NO BID 337.50$    5,062.50$      339.75$    5,096.25$      361.44$    5,421.60$      399.71$    5,995.65$      396.00$    5,940.00$      
24 24" x 50 Yard Rolls 5 NO BID 450.00$    2,250.00$      453.00$    2,265.00$      481.91$    2,409.55$      532.94$    2,664.70$      528.00$    2,640.00$      
25 30" x 50 Yard Rolls 5 NO BID 562.50$    2,812.50$      566.25$    2,831.25$      602.39$    3,011.95$      666.18$    3,330.90$      660.00$    3,300.00$      

#
Item (White DG Cubed (DG3) 
Reflective 4090 Sheeting)

Estimated 
Quantity Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost

26   9" x 50 Yard Rolls 10 NO BID 438.75$    4,387.50$      448.88$    4,488.80$      491.48$    4,914.80$      488.76$    4,887.60$      500.63$    5,006.30$      
27 12" x 50 Yard Rolls 10 NO BID 585.00$    5,850.00$      598.50$    5,985.00$      655.31$    6,553.10$      651.67$    6,516.70$      667.50$    6,675.00$      
28 18" x 50 Yard Rolls 20 NO BID 877.50$    17,550.00$     897.75$    17,955.00$     982.96$    19,659.20$     977.50$    19,550.00$     1,001.25$  20,025.00$     
29 24" x 50 Yard Rolls 10 NO BID 1,170.00$  11,700.00$     1,197.00$  11,970.00$     1,310.61$  13,106.10$     1,303.33$  13,033.30$     1,335.00$  13,350.00$     
30 30" x 50 Yard Rolls 5 NO BID 1,462.50$  7,312.50$      1,496.25$  7,481.25$      1,638.27$  8,191.35$      1,629.17$  8,145.85$      1,668.75$  8,343.75$      
31 36" x 50 Yard Rolls 5 NO BID 1,755.00$  8,775.00$      1,795.50$  8,977.50$      1,965.92$  9,829.60$      1,955.00$  9,775.00$      2,002.50$  10,012.50$     

Total 65,366.30$   133,329.40$   136,313.75$   144,478.35$   150,420.35$   152,516.30$   

Line Item Budget 12,000.00$   12,000.00$     12,000.00$     12,000.00$     12,000.00$     12,000.00$     

(Over)/Under Budget (53,366.30)$ (121,329.40)$ (124,313.75)$ (132,478.35)$ (138,420.35)$ (140,516.30)$ 

Vulcan Signs

Foley, AL

Osburn Associates, Inc.

Logan, OH Jackson, MS

Custom Products Corp. Hall Signs, Inc.

Bloomington, IN

3M Company

St. Paul, MN

Nippon Carbide 
Industries (USA) Inc.
Santa Fe Springs, CA



Village 01 uowners move 

N. BIDICONTRACT FORM 
***THIS BID WHEN ACCEPTED AND SIGNED BY AN AUTHORIZED SIGNATORY 
OF THE VILLAGE OF DOWNERS GROVE SHALL BECOME A CONTRACT 
BINDING UPON BOTH PARTIES. 

Entire Block Must Be Com~leted When A Submitted Bid Is To Be Considered For Award 

Vulcan Signs Date: 2/23/07 
Company Name 

viil ran'@vlil rnninr.  r n m  

408 E. R ~ r r y  AVP , Email Address 
Street Address of Company 

Foley AL 36535 
City, State, Zip 

5 
Business Phone 

251-943-1544 
Fax 

w M- -in 
Contact Name (Print) 

Mole Proprietor 

ATTEST: If a Corporation 

James E. Stewart. Jr. 
Print Name & Title 

I Signature of Corporation ~ e c r ( t b  - David p . Thompson 
v 

VILLAGE OF DOWNERS GROVE: 

ATTEST: 
Authorized Signature 

Signature of Village Clerk 
Title 

Date Date 

In compliance with the specifications, the above-signed offers and agrees, ifthis Bid is accepted 
within 90 calendar days from the date of opening, to furnish any or all ofthe services upon which 
prices are quoted, at the price set opposite each item, delivered at the designated point within the 
time specified above. 



Village of Downers Grove , 

IV. BIDICONTRACT FORM 
***THIS BID WHEN ACCEPTED AND SIGNED BY AN AUTHORIZED SIGNATORY 
OF THE VILLAGE OF DOWNERS GROVE SHALL BECOME A CONTRACT 
BINDING UPON BOTH PARTIES. 

Entire Block Must Be Completed When A Submitted Bid Is To Be Considered For Award 
BIDDER: 

- 
L 1-j <?maw s ,- 

Company Name 
'/Gd 

Street Address of Company 

City, State, Zip 

I Business Phone 

b'iv- V5T-333D 
Fax 

Date: 2&/P07 
s#/&@ u S ~ J W ~ D % / ~ L )  
Email Address 

Sj77gL&E LBEOX) 
Contact Name (Print) 

24-Hour Telephone 

* 
Signature of Officer, Partner or 
sole Proprietor 

Print Name & Title 

VILLAGE OF IfOWNERS GROVE: 

--- - 
Authorized Signature 

Signature of Village Clerk 
Title 

Date Date 

In compliance with the specifications, the above-signed offers and agrees, if this Bid is accepted 
within 90 calendar days from the date of opening, to furnish any or all of the services upon which 
prices are quoted, at the price set opposite each item, delivered at the designated point within the 
time specified above. 



Village of Downers Grove 

IV. BIDICONTRACT FORM 
***THIS BID WHEN ACCEPTED AND SIGNED BY AN AUTHORIZED SIGNATORY 
OF THE VILLAGE OF DOWNERS GROVE SHALL BECOME A CONTRACT 
BINDING UPON BOTH PARTIES. 

Entire Block Must Be Completed When A Submitted Bid Is To Be Considered For Award 
BIDDER: 

3M Company D ~ ~ ~ :  2-23-07 

Company Name 
tbidgroup@mmm.com 

3M Center, Bldg . 225-58-08, Box 33225 Email Address 
Street Address of Company 

Perry M. Canniff 

St. Paul, MN 55133-3225 
City, State, Zip 

Contact Name (Print) 

800-553-1380 

Business Phone 

Fax 

24-Hour Telephone 

signatur&f Officer, Partner fi/ 
Sole Proprietor 

I 

Perry M. Canniff 
Sr. Contract Administrator 

Print Name & Title 

VILLAGE OF DOWNERS GROVE: 

ATTEST: 
Authorized Signature 

Signature of Village Clerk 
Title 

Date Date 

In compliance with the specifications, the above-signed offers and agrees, if this Bid is accepted 
within 90 calendar days from the date of opening, to furnish any or all of the services upon which 
prices are quoted, at the price set opposite each item, delivered at the designated point within the 
time specified above. 


