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SYNOPSIS 
A resolution has been prepared to authorize the execution of a contract for the installation of the Zetron 
alerting system for Fire Station 2 to United Radio Communications, Inc. of Chicago, Illinois, in the 
amount of $24,600.  
 
STRATEGIC PLAN ALIGNMENT 
The Five Year Plan Goals for 2006-2011 identified Top Quality Village Infrastructure and Facilities. 
 
FISCAL IMPACT 
The Fire Station 2 project budget spans three fiscal years (FY06, 07 and 08). The total project budget is 
$10.5 million. The approved FY07 budget includes $7,635,000; $15,000 of the budget has been earmarked 
for the Zetron station alerting system. The contract amount exceeds the budget for this line item, however 
the Fire Station 2 is currently tracking under budget and there are funds available in the budget to cover 
the cost of this contract award. 
 
RECOMMENDATION 
Approval on the April 1, 2008, consent agenda. 
 
BACKGROUND 
In November 2007, the Village issued a Call for Bids for the Zetron station alerting system for the new 
Fire Station 2. No bids were received. Staff contacted several firms specializing in low voltage systems 
including all of the firms that submitted bids for the other low voltage systems for Fire Station 2 to 
determine why no bids were received. Staff learned that the design and installation of Zetron station 
alerting systems is highly specialized and most low voltage firms are not qualified to install them. Only 
one firm, United Radio Communications, Inc. indicated that they were interested in submitting a proposal. 
Staff negotiated the attached contract with United Radio Communications, Inc. The Village currently has 
a relationship with this firm. All of the Village’s Zetron equipment, service, and maintenance are currently 
provided by United Radio Communications, Inc. of Chicago. To date, staff has been satisfied with their 
work and recommends working with them for the installation of the Zetron system in Fire Station 2. 
 
The Fire Department utilizes an alerting system for each of its fire stations called Zetron. Zetron is a 
critical and essential part of the Village’s Fire/EMS alerting system. After receiving a 911 call, the Village 
Operation Center (VOC) notifies all of the fire stations of the emergency through the Zetron system. 
Zetron provides an alerting tone to the units that are assigned to the emergency along with a message from 
the VOC operator. That tone and message are also heard by all other units that are not assigned to the call. 
The alert is also simulcast over the Fire Department radios so that units not in the stations are also aware 
of the call.  
 
The scope of work includes relocating existing Village-owned equipment from the temporary Fire Station 
2 and Fire Station 3 to the new Fire Station 2, the installation of new equipment at Fire Station 2, and the 
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reprogramming of the entire Zetron system including all four fire stations and the Village Operations 
Center (VOC). 
 
ATTACHMENTS 
Resolution 
Contract Form 
Scope 



RESOLUTION NO.          

A RESOLUTION AUTHORIZING EXECUTION OF AN 
AGREEMENT BETWEEN THE VILLAGE OF DOWNERS GROVE 

AND UNITED RADIO COMMUNICATIONS, INC.

BE IT RESOLVED by the Village Council of the Village of Downers Grove, DuPage County,

Illinois, as follows:

1. That the form and substance of a certain Agreement (the “Agreement”), between the

Village of Downers Grove (the “Village”) and United Radio Communications, Inc.( “United Radio”), for 

the design and installation of a Zetron station alerting system for Fire Station 2, as set forth in the form of

the Agreement submitted to this meeting with the recommendation of the Village Manager, is hereby

approved.

2. That the Village Manager  and Village Clerk are hereby respectively authorized and

directed for and on behalf of the Village to execute, attest, seal and deliver the Agreement, substantially in

the form approved in the foregoing paragraph of this Resolution, together with such changes as the

Manager shall deem necessary.

3. That the proper officials, agents and employees of the Village are hereby authorized and

directed to take such further action as they may deem necessary or appropriate to perform all obligations

and commitments of the Village in accordance with the provisions of the Agreement.

4. That all resolutions or parts of resolutions in conflict with the provisions of this Resolution

are hereby repealed.

5. That this Resolution shall be in full force and effect from and after its passage as

provided by law.

                                                             
Mayor

Passed:
Attest:                                                    
                Village Clerk
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