ITEMm ORD 00-03895

VILLAGE OF DOWNERS GROVE
REPORT FOR THE VILLAGE COUNCIL WORKSHOP
OCTOBER 6, 2009 AGENDA

SUBJECT: TYPE: SUBMITTED BY:
v" Resolution
Adoption of Updated Building v Ordinance
Codes and a Locally Administered Motion Tom Dabareiner, AICP
Elevator Safety Program. Discussion Only | Community Development Director
SYNOPSIS

Ordinances have been prepared adopting the International Code Council’s (ICC) 2006 series of building
and fire codes, the 2008 National Electrical Code, and updated amendments to the 2004 State of Illinois
Plumbing Code. Additionally, a resolution has been prepared entering the Village into an agreement with
the State of Illinois for locally administering an Elevator Safety Program.

STRATEGIC PLAN ALIGNMENT

The Five Year Plan and Goals for 2008-2013 identified Exceptional Municipal Organization with a
supporting objective of Providing Top Quality Core Services Responsive to Current and Future
Community and Citizen Needs. Also identified was the goal of Preservation of Our Residential and
Neighborhood Character with a supporting objective of Homes and Rental Units Up to Code.

FiscAL IMPACT
N/A

UPDATE & RECOMMENDATION

This item was discussed at the September 22, 2009 workshop. During that meeting, the Village Council
requested additional information pertaining to several items. These items are summarized below:

- Whether the use of panning and ductless returns is permitted by the 2009 Energy Conservation Code.
- When the proposed building code updates would go into effect.

- Whether the proposed building codes are more or less restrictive regarding veneer vapor barriers

Regarding the use of panning and ductless returns, a new state law mandates the use of the 2009 Energy
Conservation Code. Section 403.2 deals with ducts. Under 403.2.3, "[b]Juilding framing cavities shall not
be used as supply ducts.” However, panning may support return air flow only where the building cavity is
completely sealed (403.2.2). This would require additional inspections and observation by Village
inspectors.

In addition, the IRC 2006 code further restricts the practice of panning to single floor use. While an
HVAC unit would be allowed return air flow via panning from the first floor, a second HVAC unit would
be needed to serve a second floor. Based on this, it is likely less expensive and problematic to provide for
ducted return air flow to a single HVAC unit. This concern, along with other potential issues indicated in
staff’s research (centering on mold, fire and cleanliness concerns) was and remains the basis for the
recommended amendment. While the recommendation to allow the use of building cavities for heating or
cooling non-habitable areas remains part of staff's proposed code amendments, the 2009 Energy
Conservation Code now limits this to return air flow only.

Regarding the effective date of the proposed updates to the building codes, upon approval by the Village
Council, the updated codes would be effective after 30 days.




Regarding veneer vapor barriers, in the 2007 update to the IRC's 2006 codes, several definitions were
changed. Two of these dealt with "Adhered Stone or Masonry Veneer" and "Vapor Retarder Class.” In
both cases, the new definitions reflect advancements in the materials or installation process, or
improvements in the industry's understanding of moisture removal. In both cases the new definitions
mean new or refined steps are available to achieve an equal or superior outcome, compared with earlier
versions of the building code.

Staff recommends approval on the October 6, 2009 active agenda.

BACKGROUND

The Village’s current building code was adopted in April, 2005. The building code that was adopted at
that time was the 2000 edition of the ICC codes. Staff is proposing that the Village update to the 2006
edition of the ICC’s building and fire codes, and the 2008 National Electrical Code. These codes would
apply to all commercial and residential buildings throughout the community. The 2006 editions are the
most widely adopted codes in the western suburbs. Adoption of these codes would be consistent with
comparable communities.

Additionally, since 1985, the Village has operated a local elevator safety program with Elevator
Inspection Services, Inc. (EIS). This program has consisted of performing plan reviews and inspections
for new and existing elevators and other types of vertical conveyances such as escalators, hoists, and
platform lifts through a building permit process and annual inspections. The State of Illinois has more
recently passed legislation requiring a municipality to enter into an agreement by resolution with The
Office of the State Fire Marshall (OSFM) of Illinois to continue to operate a locally administered program
and indicate compliance with standards at least as stringent as those of the State. The legislation was
prompted by elevator accidents that had occurred in rural areas of the State that had no program in place.
Currently, 166 jurisdictions, primarily in the Chicagoland area, have opted to enter into this agreement. If
a municipality chose not to operate a local program, the State would directly regulate vertical conveyances
within a municipality. Agreeing to the resolution would mean no change to the Village’s elevator
inspection program and would maintain greater scrutiny than afforded through the state program.

The specific codes targeted for adoption are:

= 2006 International Residential Code — governs construction of one and two-family residential
buildings

= 2006 International Building Code — governs construction of all other use types

= 2006 Property Maintenance Code — governs maintenance of all existing buildings and properties.

= 2006 International Fire Code- governs construction and maintenance of life safety systems in

commercial and multi-family buildings

2009 Energy Conservation Code,

2006 Fuel Gas Code,

2006 Mechanical Code,

2008 National Electrical Code - govern new construction in all building types

(Note: Additional Codes already in place are the 2004 State of Illinois Plumbing Code and the

2003 NFPA Life Safety Code)

= Nine industry standards for vertical conveyances from ANSI, ASME, and ASCE, consistent with
State requirements — governs the installation and inspection of new and existing elevators,
escalators, platform lifts, hoists, and dumbwaiters

Staff emphasized the following key concepts and strategies with the code adoption proposals:

2




= Align all regulations with specific Strategic Plan goals.

= Produce code books that are as clear and user friendly as possible.

= Reduce the number of local amendments.

= Maintain consistency with existing ordinance provisions of the Municipal Code and provide cross
references.

= Enhance clarification of the code books as written.

= Maintain and provide code provisions that address local construction practices.

= Only include amendments that measure up favorably to a benefit/cost analysis.

= Align the Village’s regulations with comparable communities.

= Obtain buy-in from the area builders, developers and property managers.

The following list highlights some of the specific key components and that will be accomplished with the
proposed updates:

= Several residential construction existing local amendments have been eliminated in order to follow
the baseline codes representing recognized industry standards.

= Sections have been reorganized and enhanced to increase the ability to locate and understand
regulations for commonly reoccurring questions.

= Several cross references to State regulations, other code book sections, and the Municipal Code
have been incorporated to increase usability of all documents.

= Conflicting provisions between various code books have been eliminated as well as provisions that
do not apply to this geographic area of the country.

= One overall updated administrative section will exist in the Municipal Code that applies to all the
various code books being adopted.

= Some updated definitions and code provisions from the 2007 ICC code development supplement
have been incorporated to increase accuracy, add clarity, and assist with code enforcement
activities.

= Long standing and recognized enhanced fire safety regulations have been maintained.

= Updates and clarifications have been provided for the pre-occupancy ordinance compliance
approval procedure.

= Clarification on materials that can be used for construction in certain zoning districts such as the
downtown area has been added.

= State authorized standards have been incorporated that assist with sizing water service supply lines
for existing residences that are being remodeled.

Staff requested input on the proposed update from the Downers Grove Chamber of Commerce,
contractors, builders, developers, architects and property managers. Staff representatives met with these
individuals on three occasions at the Downers Grove Chamber of Commerce. The IRC proposed
amendments were presented on May 14, 2009. The Mechanical, Fuel Gas, Energy Conservation, and
Property Maintenance Codes were presented on May 21, 2009. The International Building Code,
Electrical, Plumbing, and Fire Code were presented on July 16, 2009.

Based on input from this group of stakeholders, some modifications were made to the proposed codes.
The adjustments centered on clarifying proposed language. There were helpful dialogues and no
unaddressed or significant objections to the updates or the proposed amendments. Staff recommends
approval of the building codes as proposed.

ATTACHMENT
Ordinance



2006 IBC Code

ORDINANCE NO.

AN ORDINANCE ADOPTING THE 2006 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE
AND AMENDMENTSTHERETO

BE IT ORDAINED by the Village Council of the Village of Downers Grove in DuPage County,

lllinois, asfollows: (Additions are indicated by SHEING/underline; deletions by strikeout):

Section 1. That Section 7.1000.ART. ishereby added to read as follows:

7.1000.ART. Article X. INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE

Section 2. Section 7.7. is hereby renumbered to be Section 7.1001.

7.7. 2006 I nter national Building Code Adoption

The International Code Council International Building Code, as promulgated by International Code
Council ("ICC"), being particularly the 20002006 edition thereof, is hereby adopted for the purpose of
establishing rules and regulations for the congtruction, ateration, removal, demolition, equipment, use and
occupancy, location and maintenance of buildings and structures, including permits and penalties required for
such purposes. The same is adopted in its entirety, save and except such portions as are hereinafter deleted,
modified or amended, and is, together with such amendments, incorporated as fully as if set out a length
herein, and shal control in the construction of al buildings and structures therein regulated within the
Village. Said Building Code, as modified and amended, may be referred to for al purposes as the "Downers
Grove Building Code" or the "Building Code'. At least one copy of said Code, including such amendments
to it as shall be enacted, shdl be filed in the office of the Village Clerk, and additional copies shall be
available in the Community Development Department of the Village. (Ord. No. 1281, § 1; Ord. No. 1586, §
1; Ord. No. 2143, § 2; Ord. No. 2584, § 2; Ord. No. 2857, § 2; Ord. No. 3184, § 2; Ord. No. 3391, § 2.)

Section 3. Section 7.9. ishereby renumbered to be Section 7.1002.

7.9. International Building Code - Amendments.

The deletions from and modifications and amendments to the 20002006 International Building Code as
referred to in Section7-#this Article are the following:

CHAPTER 1

- Section 101.1 is amended by deleting the samein its entirety and by substituting in lieu thereof the
following:

101.1 Title. These requlations shall be known asthe Building Code of the Village of Downers
Grove, hereinafter referred to as "this code”

{2-Section 101.4.1 is amended by deleting the same in its entirety and by substituting in lieu thereof the
following:

101.4.1 Electrical. The provisions of the National Electrica Code, as adopted and amended by the
Village, shal apply to thelnstallatlon of electrica wsiems, |ncI uding alteratlons repal rs, repl acement
equipment, appliances, I ‘ ‘

Page 1 of 29



2006 IBC Code

Coderefersto-dectricafixtures fittings and appurtenances thereto.

{3)- Section 101.4.4 is amended by deleting the same in its entirety and by substituting in lieu thereof the
following:

101.4.4 Plumbing. The provisions of the State of I1linois State-Plumbing Code, as adopted and
amended by the Village, shall apply to theingtallation, ateration, repairs, and replacement of plumbing
systems, including equipment, appliances, fixtures, fittings and appurtenances, and where connected to a
water sawage system and all aspects of amedical gas system. The provisions of the Village of Downers
Grove Municipa Code shall apply to private sewage disposal systems.

Section 102 is amended by deleting the same in its entirety and addressed in Chapter 7, Article | of the

Downers Grove Municipal Code.

Section 103 isamended by deleting the sameit in its entirety and addressed in Chapter 7, Article |l of the
Downers Grove Municipal Code.

Section 104.1 through Section 104.8 are amended by deleting the same in their entirety and addressed in
Chapter 7 Article |l of the Downers Grove Municipa Code.

Section 104.9.1 is amended by deleting the first sentence.

Section 105.1.1 is amended by deleting the sameit in its entirety.

Section 105.1.2 is amended by deleting the sameit inits entirety.

{6)-Section 105.2 is amended by deleting building conditions 1 through 13 in their the samethtsentirety
and by substituting in lieu thereof the following:

105.2 Work exempt from permit. Exemptions from permit requirements of this code shall not be
deemed to grant authorization for any work to be donein any manner in violation of the provisions of this
code or any other laws or ordinances of thisjurisdiction. Permits shall not be required for the following:

Building:

1 One-story detached accessory structures used astool, storage sheds, and similar uses with afloor
areanot exceeding one hundred (100) square fest.

2. Retaining wallsthat are not over three (3) feet in height measured from grade to the top of the wall.

3. Painting, papering, tiling, carpeting, cabinets, counter tops, and similar finish work.

4, Prefabricated swimming pools accessory to a Group R-3 occupancy that are less than 24 inches deep,
do not exceed 5,000 gallons and are installed entirely above ground.

5. Nonfixed and movable fixtures, cases, racks, counters, and partitions not over 5 feet 9 inchesin
height.

Page 2 of 29



2006 IBC Code

Section 105.3 through Section 105.7 are anended by deleting the samein their entirety and addressed in
Chapter 7 Article 1l of the Downers Grove Municipal Code.

Section 106.1 through Section 106.5 are amended by deleting the samein their entirety and addressed in
Chapter 7, Article |V _of the Downers Grove Municipal Code.

Section 108.1 through Section 108.6 are amended by deleting the samein their entirety and addressed in
Chapter 7, Article VIl of the Downers Grove Municipal Code.

Section 109.1 through Section 109.2 are amended by deleting the samein their entirety and addressed in
Chapter 7, Article V_of the Downers Grove Municipa Code.

Page 3 of 29



2006 IBC Code

Section 109.3.8 is amended by deleting the same in its entirety and by substituting in lieu thereof the

following:

109.3.8 Other Inspections. |n addition to the inspections specified above, the building officid is
authorized to make or require other inspections of any construction work to ascertain compliance with the
provisions of this code and other laws that are enforced by the Village. Additional inspections may include
the following as applicable to the project:

Foundation and draintile prior to backfill.

Underground and rough utilities

Plumbing stack test

Insulation

Electrical services prior to activation

Rough ceilings

All fire and life safety systems as required by the code official.

N©@O|dW(N =

Section 110 is amended by deleting the same in its entirety and addressed in Chapter 7, Article V11 of the
Downers Grove Municipal Code.

Section 112 is amended by deleting the same in its entirety and addressed in Chapter 7, Article | X of the
Downers Grove Municipal Code.

Page 4 of 29



2006 IBC Code

Section 113 is amended by deleting the samein its entirety and addressed in Chapter 7, Article X _of the
Downers Grove Municipal Code.

Page 5 of 29



2006 IBC Code

Section 115 is amended by deleting the samein its entirety and by substituting in lieu thereof the following:
115 Unsafe structures and equipment. The provisions of the International Property Maintenance
Code as adopted and amended by the Village shall apply.

CHAPTER 2

Section 202 is amended asfollows:

202 Definitions.

The definition of Vapor Retarder is amended by deleting the samein its entirety and by substituting
in lieu thereof the following:

Vapor Retarder Class. A measure of amaterial or assembly’s ability to limit the amount of
moisture that passes through that material or assembly. Vapor retarder class shall be defined using the
desiccant method of ASTM E-96 asfollows,

Class|: 0.1 perm or less
Classll: permisgreater than .1 and lessthan or equal to 1.0 perm
Class|lI: perm is greater than 1.0 and less than or equal to 10 perm

CHAPTER 4

6)- Section 403.1 is amended by deleting the-second-exeeption—_first paragraph in its entirety and by
substituting in lieu thereof the following:

403.1 Applicability. The provisions of this section shall apply to buildings with an occupied floor
located more than fifty-five (55) feet above the lowest level of Fire Department vehicle access as measured
from grade to the floor elevation of the top occupied floor.

All exceptions shall remain, however, Exception #2 shall be deleted in its entirety.

&H-Section 403.2 is amended by deleting the exceptions thereto in their entirety.

Page 6 of 29



2006 IBC Code

Section 403.12.1 shall be amended by deleting the samein its entirety and by substituting in lieu thereof the

following:
403.12.1 Stairway communications system. See Section 907.2.12.3 for reguirements.

Section 403.13 shall be amended by deleting the samein its entirety and by substituting in lieu thereof the
following:

403.13 Smokepr oof exit enclosures. Every required stairway serving floors more than fifty-five
(55) feet above the lowest level of fire department vehicle access measured from grade to the floor elevation
of the top occupied floor shall comply with Sections 909.20 and 1020.1.7.

Section 406.5.2 shall be amended by deleting the first paragraph in its entirety and by substituting in lieu
thereof the following:

406.5.2 Canopies. Canopies under which fuels are dispensed shall have a clear, unobstructed height
of not |lessthan thirteen (13) feet six (6) inchesto the lowest projecting e ement in the vehicle drive-through
area. Canopy structures and their supports over pumps shall be of noncombustible materials. Plastic facing
material shall comply with the following:

All exceptions shall remain, however, Exception #1 shall be deleted in its entirety.

Section 414.5.4 shall be amended by deleting the "I CC Electrical Code" and by substituting in lieu thereof

thefollowing:
"National Electric Code as adopted and amended by the Village.

Section 415.6.4 shall be amended by deleting the "I nternational Plumbing Code" and by substituting in lieu
thereof the following:
"State of |llinois Plumbing Code as adopted and amended by the Village'

{20)-Section 415.9.2.8:18.2.8.1 isamended by deleting the words “1CC Electrical Code” and substituting in
lieu thereof the following:
Fhe!'Nationa Electrica Code as adopted and amended by the Village”.

CHAPTERS

2H-Table 503 is amended asfollows: by

1. Type V-A and V-B is not permitted for all use groups governed by this codein all zoning districts.

Page 7 of 29



2006 IBC Code

2. Typelll-A, 111-B, and IV shall be limited to no more than thirty-five (35) feet in story height as
defined by this code above the lowest level of Fire Department vehicle access for all use groups.
3. Typelll-A, 111-B, shal not be permitted in the downtown business (DB) and downtown transition

(DT) zoning districts.
Exception: Restoration or remodeling for existing non-conforming structures of type V-A, V-B, l1I-A, [11-B
shall be permitted when the project area does not exceed thirty-five percent (35% )of the total building square

footage.

Section 504.2 shall be amended by adding the following provision at the end of thefirst paragraph:
"This section shall not be applied to Type |11-B construction."

Section 506.1 shall be amended by deleting the first paragraph in its entirety and substituting in lieu thereof
the following paragraph:

506.1 General. With the exception of Type |l1-B construction, the areas limited by Table 503 shall
be permitted to be increased due to frontage and automatic sprinkler system protection in accordance with the

following:

Section 507.2 is amended by deleting the same inits entirety.

Section 507.3 shall be amended by deleting the first paragraph in its entirety and substituting in lieu thereof
thefollowing paragraph:

507.3 Sprinklered onestory. The areaof aone-story, Group B, F, M or S building or a one-story
Group A-4 building, of other than Type V and Type |11-B construction, shall not be limited when the building
is provided with an automatic sprinkler system throughout it in accordance with Section 903.3.1.1 and is
surrounded and adjoined by public ways or yards not |ess than sixty (60) feet (18 288mm) in width.

Exception #2 is deleted in its entirety.
Thefirst sentence of Exception #3 is amended to read asfollows:
Group A-1 and A-2 occupancies of other than aTypelll-B or Type V construction shall be
permitted, provided:

Section 507.4 shall be deleted in its entirety and substituting in lieu thereof the following:

507.4. Two story. The area of atwo-story, Group B, F, M or S building of other than a Typell1-B
or Type V construction shall not be limited when the building is equipped throughout with an automatic
sprinkler system in accordance with Section 903.3.1.1, and is surrounded and adjoined by public ways or
yards not |ess than sixty (60) feet (18 288 mm) in width.

Section 509.4 is amended to add the following exception:
Exceptions;
1. SeeTable 503 as amended.

Section 509.5 is amended by deleting the same inits entirety.

Section 509.7 is amended to add the words "as amended" following the phrase "limitationsin Section 503" in
the second sentence of thefirst paragraph.

CHAPTER 6

Table 601 is hereby amended to read asfollows:
Table 601 Fire-Resistance Rating Requirementsfor Building Elements (hour s).

Page 8 of 29



2006 IBC Code

See Table 503, as amended, for construction type restrictions.

Table 602 is hereby amended to read asfollows:
Table 602 Fire-Resistance Rating Requir ementsfor Exterior Walls Based on Fir e Separ ation
Distance.

See Table 503, as amended, for construction type restrictions.

Section 603.1.2 is amended by deleting the words “ I nternational Plumbing Code” and substituting in lieu
thereof the following:
"the State of Illinois Plumbing Code as adopted and amended by the Village"

Section 603.1.3 is amended by deleting the words “1CC Electrical Code” and substituting in lieu thereof the

following:
"the National Electrical Code as adopted and amended by the Village"

CHAPTER 7

22-Section 7167.5 Exception #5 is amended by deleting the words “ International Plumbing Code” and
substituting in lieu thereof the following:
Hhneis!" State of Illinois Plumbing Code as adopted and amended by the Village"

CHAPTER 9
{23)-Section 901.6 is amended by deleting the samein its entirety and by substituting in lieu thereof the

following:
901.6 Superwsory Serwceﬁ

shall be superwsed by aconnectlon to the Vi Ilage Operatlons Center in the manner specmed by Section
17.58 of the Municipal Code._All alarm and detection services-and shall transmit alarm, supervisory, and
trouble signals.

Section 901.6.2 is amended by deleting Exception #1 and Exception #2 in their entirety.

Section 901.6.3 is amended by deleting the Exception in its entirety.

Section 901.8 is hereby added asfollows:
901.8 NFPA Standard editions. The following NFPA standards editions including all appendices

and hereby adopted:

NFPA 13, 2007

NFPA 13-D, 2002

NFPA 13-R, 2002

NFPA 14, 2007

NFPA 20, 2007

NFPA 25, 2008

NFPA 96, 2008

NFPA 30B, 2007

NFPA 72, 2007

{24)—Sections-903- 1 through-903.2.12 are 903.2 is amended by deleting the same in theirits entirety and by
substituting in lieu thereof the following:

Page 9 of 29



2006 IBC Code

903.22 Where Required. Automatic sprinkler systems shall be installed and maintained in full
operating condition, as specified in this code, in al buildings and structures, including open parking

structures,—+egardiess-ofstreetfrontage-or-fire-walls, which exceed two stories or twenty-five (25) feet in
height or which have atota areain excess of the gpplicable square footage listed in Table 903.

TABLE 903

Total area square footages above which installation of automatic sprinkler systemsis required:

Typesof Construction

Page 10 of 29

Use Group TypelA, 1B; | Type2CA, | Type3A, Type43B Type5A,
2A-and- 2B 2B 3B 5B4
A-1 Assembly, theaters 0 0 0 0 0
A-2 Assembly, nightclubs and similar uses 0 0 0 0 0
A-3 Assembly (lecture halls, recreation 0 0 0 0 0
centers, terminals, restaurants other than
night clubs
A-4 Assembly, churches 0 0 0 0 0
A-5 Assembly 0 0 0 0 0
B Business 1,500 1,500 1,500 1,500 15000
E Educational 50002500 | 5;0002,500 | 5,0002,500 | 5,0001,500 5,0000
F-1 Factory and industrial, moderate 50002500 | 5;0002,500 | 5,0002,500 | 5,0001,500 5,0000
F-2 Factory and industrial, low 50002500 | 5;0002,500 | 5,0002,500 | 5,0001,500 5,0000
H-1 High hazard, detonation hazards Automatic- 0 0 0 0
Sprinkler
S s_te: '
Reguired-n-
AHO
H-2 High hazard, deflagration hazards Automatic- 0 0 0 0
Sprinkler
S s_te: '
Reguired-n-
AHO
H-3 High hazard, physical hazards Automatic- 0 0 0 0
Sprinkler
S S.EE“
Requiredn-
AHO




2006 IBC Code

H-4 High hazard, health hazards Audtomatic- 0 0 0 0
Sprinkler
%s_ten
Reguired-n-
AHQ
I-1 Indtitutional, residential care Automatic- 0 0 0 0
Sprinkler
S s.ten '
Requiredn-
AHQ
I-2 Ingtitutional, incapacitated Automatic- 0 0 0 0
Sprinkler
%s_ten
Reguired-n-
AHQ
1-3 Ingtitutional, restrained Automatic- 0 0 0 0
Sprinkler
S s.ten '
Requiredn-
AHQ
1-4 |ndtitutional 0 0 0 0 0
M Merchantile 2,500 2,500 2,500 2,5001,500 2,5000
R-1, 2, 3, 4 (except detached one and two- Automatic- 0 0 0 0
family) Residential;-hotels Sprinkler
S s.ten '
Requiredn-
AHQ
i dential_multile famil . - ired "
S-1 Storage, moderate 5.0002,500 | 5;0002,500 | 5;0002,500 | 5,0001,500 5,0000
S-2 Storage, low 5.0002,500 5.0002,500 | 5;0002,500 | 5;0001,500 | 5;0000
U Utility, misc.
ity rrise

Section 903.2.1 through Section 903.2.9.1 are hereby deleted in their entirety.

Section 903.2.10.1 is amended by deleting the same in its entirety and by substituting in lieu thereof the

following:

903.2.10.1 Stories and basements without openings. An automatic sprinkler system shall be

installed throughout every story and basement of all buildings in accordance with Table 903.

Section 903.2.10.1.2 is hereby deleted in its entirety.

Page 11 of 29




2006 IBC Code

Section 903.2.10.1.3 is hereby deleted in its entirety.

Section 903.2.10.3 is amended by deleting Exception #2 and Exception #3.

Section 903.3 shall be deleted in its entirety and substituting in lieu thereof the following:
903.3 I ngtallation requirements. Automatic sprinkler systems shall be designed and installed in
accordance with Section 903.3.1 through Section 903.3.7. In addition, a check valve shall be provided in all

sprinkler risers.

Section 903.3.1 isamended by adding the folloing at the end of the paragraph:
Theuse of XL thin-wall pipeis prohibited.

25)—Section 903.3.1.1.1 is amended by omitting Condition #4 and adding.in lieu of the following exception
at the conclusion thereof:

"64. Sprinklers may be-omitted-fromnot be required in attics, crawl spaces, floor ceiling spaces, and
other concealed spaces that are not used or intended for living purposes or storage if approved by the code
officia.”

Section 903.3.2 is amended by adding the following condition:
"4. All business and assembly occupancies.

{26)-Section 903.3.5 isamended by deleting the words “ I nternational Plumbing Code” and substituting in
lieu thereof the following:
"Hineis State of Illinois Plumbing Code as adopted and amended by the Village®

2H-Section 903.3.5.3. isamended by adding the following section:
903.3.5.3 Post Indication Valve Prohibited. The use of post indicator valves and wall post indicator
valves are prohibited.

Section 903.4 is amended by del eting Exception #2 through Exception #7.

Section 903.6 isis hereby added asfollows:

903.6 Hydraulic information and nameplate. For sprinkler drawing review and approval, a copy
of the hydraulic calculations sealed by the fire protection engineer, shall be submitted for each calculated
area. For full approval of the system, a copy of each hydraulic nameplate must be submitted.

Page 12 of 29



2006 IBC Code

Page 13 of 29



2006 IBC Code

{48)Section 904.3.1 is amended by deleting the words "1CC Electrica Code" and substituting in lieu thereof
thefollowing:

!FheNationa Electrica Code as adopted and amended by the Village'-

Section 905.2.1 isis hereby added asfollows:

905.2.1 Firehosevalvesystem. Thefire hose valve piping system shall be:

1 A separate riser piping system from the domestic water service.

2. Hydraulicaly calculated for a minimum of 250 gpm at 75 ps at the most hydraulically remote fire
hose valve.

3. Where system pressures exceed 100 psi, provide Potter reduced pressure field adjustable type valves.

£50)Section 905.3.1 isamended by deleting "30 feet (9144 mm)" and by substituting in lieu thereof the
Page 14 of 29



2006 IBC Code

following;
"22 feet"

{51)Section 905.3.2 is amended by deleting the exceptionsin their entirety.

£52)Section 905.4 is amended by adding the following:

7. The number of risers for multi-story buildings shall be such that al parts of every floor area can
be reached by a 30-foot hose stream from a nozzle attached to not more than 100 feet of hose connected to a
riser outlet. Standpipe hose connections shall be required to be located in enclosed stairways at each level in
multi-story buildings.

8. In all warehouse storage areas where storage exceeds twelve (12) feet in height, provide 2-1/2”
fire hose valves with 1-1/2" reducer to a 1-1/2” connection. L ocate the valves at each door entrance to the
warehouse and /or storage area. Provide additional 2-1/2” fire hose valves throughout the space so that no
portion of the warehouse/storage areais more than one hundred twenty (120) feet maximum travel distance to
afire hose vave.

£53)Section 905.7.3 is amended by adding anew section asfollows:
905.7.3 Hose connection within the cCabinet-Equipment-Specifications. The hose connection

shdl be not more than 5 feet above the floor and consist of a 2 1/2" size-reh-hose-connection-with vaves
and threads eeniemrr—ng—te—l%re@epartment—r n conformance wi th Vrllaqe standards. H—deemed—neeoemw—by

Section 905.7.3.1 is hereby added asfollows:

905.7.3.1 Additional/alternate hose requirement. An additiona or aternate hose connection
consisting of one hundred (100) feet of 1-1/2" fire hose, shut-off valve, nozzle, couplings, rack or cabinet
may be required as determined by the code official.

Section 907.1.2.1 is hereby added asfollows:

907.1.2.1 Addressablefirealarm systems. All fire alarm systems shall be of the addressable type.

Section 907.1.2.2 is hereby added asfollows:
907.1.2.2 Separate zonesregquired. Manual fire alarm pulls, audio visuals, and other detection
devices shall be on separate zones per floor of a multi-story building.

{55)Section 907.2 isamended by ddeting the samein its entirety and by substituting in lieu thereof the
following:
907 2 Where Requrred éa)—An approved manual and automatrc frre aIarm system—shal-l—be installed

new bUIldI ngs, structureﬁ and addltlons qoverned by this code. For existing buildings, the requirements of

thelnternatlond Fi re Code, Section 907. 3 asamended shall apply. -Pevices-combination-of devices-
. )07-1.2-The automatic fire detectors shall be smoke

Page 15 of 29



2006 IBC Code

detectors. Where ambient conditions prohl bit installation of automatl c smoke detecti on, other automatl cfire
detectlonshallbedlowed t-an-a y ‘ tveh ] .

62)Section 907.2.12 isamended by deleting " 75 feet (22 860 mm)" and substituting the following in lieu
thereof:
"455 feet"

Section 907.2.12 is further amended by deleting Exception #2 through Exception #5in their entirety.

{63)Section 907.2.12.3 is amended by deleting the first and second sentence of the first paragraph in their
entirety and by substituting in lieu thereof the following:

907.2.12.3 Firedepartment communication system. An approved two-way hard-wired and radio
fire department communication system designed and installed in accordance with NFPA 72 shall be provided

for fire department use. It shall operate between afire command center complying with Section 911 and
eevators, € evator lobbies, emergency and standby power rooms, fire pump rooms, building engineer's office,

remote alarm panel and remote sprinkler riser locations, areas of refuge and inside enclosed exit stairways.

Section 907.2.12.3 is further amended by deleting the exception.

Section 907.2.12.3.1 is hereby added as follows:

907.2.12.3.1 Communication system equipment. Thetwo-way hard-wired communications
system shall consist of atelephone system with plug-in handsets capable of use in the designated jacks.
L ocation of the jacks, zoning of the two-way system, and the number of handsets required is subject to
review and approval by the Fire Department for site specific conditions.

Section 907.2.12.3.2 is hereby added asfollows:

907.2.12.3.2 High rise wireless communication system standards and testing. Minimum
standards for wireless radio communication systems design and testing shall be obtained from the Fire
Prevention Bureau and consist of the following:
1 A professionally engineered system shall be capable of transmitting at a minimum of -90 decibel

Page 16 of 29



2006 IBC Code

milliwatt (dBm) for over 90% of in-building coverage. The owner shall furnish atest report upon completion
of the system installation verifying compliance with this requirement.

2. The system shall be capable of operating on an independent battery and/or generator system for a
period of at |east twleve (12) hours without external power input. The battery system shall automatically
chargein the presence of external power input. There shall be no connectivity between the radio system and
firedarm system.

3. Proof of maintenance and an annual inspection by a qualified radio technician shall be provided to

the fire department through a certificate of annua inspection.

4, Village personnel shall have the right to enter onto the property to conduct field testing to be certain
that the required level of radio coverageis present.

5. The property owner shal be responsible for repairs, replacement, or upgrades to the system as

directed by the Village should the system fail or no longer function.

{65)Section 907.2.18.1 is amended by deleting the phrase "or similar rooms' and adding the following to #1
after the word "machine"; "fire larm room and sprinkler room".

£66)Section 907.2.19 isamended by adding the words "and automatic fire detection system” after the words
"manual fire darm system".

{68)Section 907.5 isamended by deleting the words "I CC Electrical Code" and substituting in lieu thereof
thefollowing:
"Nationa Electrica Code as adopted and amended by the Village!

£69)Section 907.8.2 isamended by deleting " 75 feet (22 860 mm)" and substituting the following in lieu
thereof:
"4055 feet"

) Section 907.14 isamended by a o\ a
init's enti retv are substituting in lieu thereof thefollowmq

M onltormq All alarm and detectlon svstemsasd&ecrlbed in Sectlon 907 of thls code shaII besuperwsed by
aconnection to the Village Operations Center per the requirements of Section 17.58 of the Municipal Code
and shall transmit alarm, supervisory, and trouble signals.

Exceptions:
1. Supervisory serviceis not required for automatic sprinkler systemsin one- and two-family dwellings.
2. Any property within the municipal limits of the Village which is under the jurisdiction of afire

protection district organized pursuant to state law shall connect to the alarm receiving panels of thefire
protection district and must be approved by the Village.

Page 17 of 29



2006 IBC Code

£3)Section 909.11 is amended by deleting the words “1CC Electrical Code” and substituting in lieu thereof
the following:
"Nationd Electrica Code as adopted and amended by the Village!

#4)——Section 909.12.1 is amended by deleting the same ir-ts-entiretythe words "I CC Electrical Code" and
by subgtituting in lieu thereof the following:

£75)Section 909.16.3 isamended by deleting the words “I CC Electrical Code” and substituting in lieu thereof
the following:
"National Electrical Code as adopted and amended by the Village!

FHSection 911.1 is amended by deleting 12 and-13 in theirits entirety and by substituting in lieu thereof the
following:
911. 1 Fr-reGemmanel—GenterFeatur&

‘ r A comQIete
set of flrealarm plans specrflcatlons, |nstruct|on manual and bUIldI ng plansrndrcatl ng thetyplcal floor plan
and detailing the building core, means of egress, fire protection systems, fire fighting equipment, and fire
department access.

A

{#8)-Section 911.1 is further amended by adding the following:
16. Handsetsfor lH-reelepartrnentthe communlcatlons system, properly labeled, and in locked
box(es).

17. A current Irst of key personnel wrth phone numbers

18. A number of compl ete sets of keyseespeer—treel—by—their—redepaﬁment—for the bUI|dI ng elevators

alarm system, and any

teJeeeIeerls,Lmarked-ﬁer—ielentmeanenother Iocked svstems as specrfled bv the F| re Department
19. A Hhigh-rise equipment box as A

speerﬁed—by—theﬂre@epmment—?hebex—shw-besecured W-I-t-hl nclose pI’OXI mlty tothefire command room.
Box and content per the Fire Department's specifications.

Section 912.1 is amended by deleting the sameinits entirety and substituting in lieu thereof the following:

9.12.1 Ingtallation. Fire department connections shall be installed in accordance with the NFPA
standard applicable to the system design and shall comply with al applicable requirements of the Municipal
Code

F#9YA-nrew-Section 912.1.1 is hereby added asfollows:
Page 18 of 29



2006 IBC Code

912.1.1 Yard hydrants. Fire hydrants shall be provided around the perimeter of the building in
three hundred (300) feet. increments. A municipal fire hydrant shall be located within one hundred (100) feet
of the fire department connection on the fire protection water supply to the building. All locations are subject
to review and approval by the code official for site specific conditions.

Section 912.1.1.1 is hereby added asfollows:
912.1.1.1 Hydrant testing. Yard hydrants shall be tested annually and a report must be submitted
to the Fire Department for review and approval.

Section 912.1.1.1.1 is hereby added asfollows:
912.1.1.1.1 Stortz connections. For buildings with large sprinkler systems or water demands as
determined by the code official, aminimum of afive (5) inch STORTZ connection is required.

Section 912.5 is amended by deleting the words “ International Plumbing Code’ and substituting in lieu
thereof the following:
"State of Illinois Plumbing Code as adopted and amended by the Village"

Section 913 FIRE PUMPSis hereby added

Section 913.1 is hereby added asfollows:

913.1 Fire pump. When a fire pump is installed, it shall operate automaticaly at all times by
connection to an automatically switched emergency power generator sized per the requirements of the
National Electrical Code.

Section 913.2 is hereby added asfollows:
913.2 Fire pump test headers and valves. Where fire pumps are installed, an outside test header
and an OS & Y control valveisrequired.

Section 913.3 is hereby added asfollows:

913.3 Fire rating for value room and fire pump rom. All rooms containing sprinkler valve
equipment and fire pumps shall be separated from adjoining spaces with a minimum of 2-hour rated
assemblies.

Section 913.4 is hereby added asfollows:
913.4 Accessfor valve room and fire pump room. A minimum of two-3 foot wide, 1-hour rated
doors shall provide access to the valve and fire pump room, located at an interior and exterior wall of the

building.

Page 19 of 29



2006 IBC Code

CHAPTER 10

Section 1001.3 is amended by adding the the words "and the International Property Maintenance Code, as
amended and adopted by the Village", at the end of the sentence.

Section 1003.5 is amended by deleting the exceptions therein and substituting in lieu thereof the following:

Exceptions:

1 A single step with a maximum riser height of seven (7) inchesis permitted at exterior doors not
required to be accessible by the State of |llinois Accessibility Code.

2. Steps and stairs are permitted at locations as permitted by the State of |llinois Accessibility Code.

Section 1006.3 is amended by adding the following at the end of the section:

"Where emergency lighting is powered by a generator, a minimum of twenty percent (20%) of the
emergency light fixtures shall be provided with battery back-up. For multi-story buildings, batter powered
units shall be provided in enclosed stairways for proper illumination of each story. "

Section 1007.1 is amended by adding at the end of the first sentence "and al applicable provisions of the
State of |llinois Accessibility Code'.
Section 1007.1 is further amended by deleting the exceptions.

Section 1007.2 is amended by deleting Condition #1 ini its entirety and substituting in lieu thereof the

following:
1. Accessible routes complying with the State of llinois Accessibility Code.

Section 1007.2.1 isdeleted in its entirety and substituting in lieu thereof the following:
1007.2.1 Elevators required. In buildings where a required accessible floor is above or below a
level of exit discharge, an €levator shall be provided per the State of Illinois Accessibility Code.

Section 107.2.1 is further amended by deleting the exceptions.

Section 1008.1.1 is amended by is amended by deleting "'28 inches (711 mm)" in Exception #2 only and
substituting the following in lieu thereof:
"32inches’

CHAPTER 11

{83)-Chapter 11 is amended by deleting the same in its entirety; see State of |llinois Accessibility Code.

CHAPTER 12

£84)Section 12045.4.1 isamended by deleting the words "1CC Electrical Code" and substituting in lieu
Page 20 of 29



2006 IBC Code

thereof the following:
"National Electrical Code as adopted and amended by the Village!

{85)Section 12056.3.3 isamended by deleting the words "International Plumbing Code' and substituting in
lieu thereof the following:

Hhneis!" State of Illinois Plumbing Code as adopted and amended by the Village'.
CHAPTER 13

£86)Section 1301.2 is hereby added asfollows:
1301 2 GemGheekA—nspeeHen—L—ist—RequedComputer software programs. A—Gem@heele

Compllanoe W|th the code provisions deSCI’I bed therein may be
demonstrated with the use of COM check software for al building types governed by this code. For projects
with documents prepared by a State of 1llinois licensed design professional, the submittal shall be sealed by
the design professional of record.

CHAPTER 14
{8ASection 1405.10.4 isamended by deleting the words "I CC Electrical Code" and subgtituting in lieu
thereof the following:
"Nationa Electrica Code as adopted and amended by the Village!
CHAPTER 15

Section 1502.1 is amended by addling the following definitions:;
AGGREGATE. In roofing, crushed stone, crushed dag or water-worn gravel used for surfacing for

roof coverings.
BALLAST. Balast is any item having weight that is used to hold or steady an object. In roofing,

ballast comesin theform of large stones or paver systems or light-weight interlocking paver systems and is
used to provide uplift resistance for roofing systems that are not adhered or mechanically attached to the roof

deck.

£88)Section 1503.4 is amended by deleting the words " International Plumbing Code" and substituting in lieu
thereof the following:
Hineis! State of Illinois Plumbing Code as adopted and amended by the Village!

CHAPTER 16
Section 1603.1.6 is amended by deleting the words "in Section 1612.3" and substituting in lieu thereof the

following:
"by local flooding data"

TABLE 1608.2 is hereby deleted in its entirety.

Section 1612.3 shall be deleted in its entirety and substituting in lieu thereof the following:
1612.3 Establishment of flood hazard areas. To establish flood hazard areas, loca flooding data

shall apply.

Page 21 of 29



2006 IBC Code

Section 1612.5 shall be amended by deleting Condition 2 and subsections thereof in their entirety.

Figure 1613.5(3) through Figure 1613.5(14) are hereby deleted in their entirety.

CHAPTER 17

Section 1701.3 is hereby deleted in its entirety.

Section 1704.1 is amended by deleting Exception #2 and Exception #3 in their entirety.

Section 1704.1.1 is amended by deleting Exception #1 in its entirety.

Section 1704.4 is amended by deleting the exceptions.

Section 1704.5 is amended by deleting the exceptions.

Section 1705.3 through Section 1705.4.2 are hereby deleted in their entirety.

Section 1707 through Section 1709 are hereby deleted in their entirety.

CHAPTER 18

Section 1802.2 is amended by deleting the exception.

Section 1802.2.3 is amended by deleting the exception.

Section 1802.2.6 is hereby deleted in its entirety.

Section 1802.2.7 is hereby deleted in its entirety.

Section 1803.4 shall be amended by deleting Condition 3 in its entirety.

Section 1805.2.1 shall be amended by deleting Condition 2 and Condition 3 in their entirety.
Section 1805.2.1 shall further be amended by deleting the exceptions.

Section 1805.5.1.3 is hereby deleted in its entirety.

Section 1805.5.5.1 shall be amended by deleting Condition 2 in its entirety.

Section 1805.5.5.2 shall be amended by deleting Condition 2, Condition 3 and Condition 4 in their entirety.

Section 1805.9 is hereby deleted in its entirety.

Section 1807.1 is amended by deleting the first paragraph in its entirety and substituting in lieu thereof the

Page 22 of 29



2006 IBC Code

following:
1807.1 Whererequired. Walls or portions thereof that retain earth and enclose interior spaces and
floor below grade shall be waterproofed and dampproofed in accordance with this section.

Section 1807.1.2.1 is hereby deleted in its entirety and substituting in lieu thereof the following:

1807.1.2.1 Flood hazard areas. For buildings and structures in flood hazard areas as established by
local flooding data, the finished ground level of an under-floor space shall be determined by the provisions of
the Municipa Code.

Section 1807.2.1 is hereby deleted in its entirety and substituting in lieu thereof the following:
1807.2.1 Floors. Dampproofing materials for floors shall beinstalled between the floor and the base
course required by Section 1807.4.1.

Section 1807.4.3 is amended by deleting the "I nternational Plumbing Code' and substituting in lieu thereof

the following:
"State of Illinois Plumbing Code as adopted and amended by the Village and the Municipal Code."

Section 1807.4.3 is further amended by deleting the exception.

Section 1808.2.23 through 1808.2.23.2.3 are hereby deleted in their entirety.

Section 1809.2.2.2.1 is hereby deleted in its entirety.

Section 1809.2.2.2.2 is hereby deleted in its entirety.

Section 1809.2.3.2.1 is hereby deleted in its entirety.

Section 1809.2.3.2.2 is hereby deleted in its entirety.

Section 1810.1.2.1 is hereby deleted in its entirety.

Section 1810.1.2.2 is hereby deleted in its entirety.

Section 1810.3.5 is hereby deleted in its entirety.

Section 1810.5.4.1 is hereby deleted in its entirety.

Section 1810.6.4.1 is hereby deleted in its entirety.

Section 1810.8.4.1 is hereby deleted in its entirety.

Section 1811.5 is hereby deleted in its entirety.

CHAPTER 19

Section 1904.4 is amended by deleting Condition 11.

Section 1908.1.4 is amended by deleting Section 21.2.1.3 and Section 21.2.1.4

Section 1908.1.6 is hereby deleted in its entirety.

Page 23 of 29



2006 IBC Code

Section 1908.1.15 through Section 1908.1.16 are hereby deleted in their entirety.

CHAPTER 21

Section 2106.4 thr ough Section 2106.6 are hereby deleted in their entirety.

Section 2109.8 through Section 2109.8.4.7 are hereby deleted in their entirety.

Section 2111.4 is hereby deleted in its entirety.

Section 2111.4.1 is hereby deleted in its entirety.
Section 2112.4 is hereby deleted inits entirety.

Section 2113.4 is hereby deleted in its entirety.

CHAPTER 22

Section 2205.2.2 is hereby deleted in its entirety.

Section 2205.3.1 is hereby deleted in its entirety.

CHAPTER 23

Section 2305.2.4.1 is hereby deleted in its entirety.

Section 2305.3.11 ishereby deleted in its entirety.

Section 2307.1.1 is hereby deleted in its entirety.

Section 2308.12 is hereby deleted in its entirety.

Section 2308.12.1 is hereby deleted in its entirety.

Section 2308.12.2 is hereby amended to del ete the exceptions.

Table 2308.12.4 is hereby deleted in its entirety.

Section 2308.12.6 is hereby deleted in its entirety.

Section 2308.12.9 is hereby deleted in its entirety.

CHAPTER 27

{90)-Chapter 27 isamended by deleting the chapter in its entirety werds1CC-Electrical Code™and
substituting in lieu thereof the following:
See the National Electrical Code as adopted and amended by the Village.

CHAPTER 29

Page 24 of 29



2006 IBC Code

{91 Chapter 29 isamended by deleting the samein its entirety and substituting in lieu thereof the

following:
Seethe State of |llinois Plumbing Code as adopted and amended by the Village.

CHAPTER 30

Section 3001.2 is hereby deleted inits entirety and substituting in lieu thereof the following:

3001.2 Referenced standar ds. The design, construction, installation, alteration, repair, and
maintenance of elevators and conveying systems and their components shall conform to the State of Illinois
Elevator Safety and Regulation Act and to the following state mandated elevator codes as determined by the
office of the state fire marshal, division of elevator safety:

Safety Codefor Elevators and Escalators (ASME A17.1-2007/CSA, B44-07);

Performance-Based Safety Code for Elevators and Escalators (ASME A17.1-2007/CSA-B44.7-07);

Guide for Inspection of Elevators, Escaators and Moving Walks (ASME A17.2-2004);

Safety Code for Existing Elevators and Escalators (ASME A17.3-2005);

Saftey Standard for Platform Lifts and Stairway Chairlifts (ASME A18.1-2005);

Standards for the Qualification of Elevator |nspectors (ASME QEI-1-2007);

Safety Requirements for Personnel Hoists and Employee Elevators (ANSI A10.4-2004);

Automated People Mover Standard (ASCE 21-05) Part 1, 2006;

Automated People Mover Standards (ANSI/ASCE/T & DI 21.2-08) Parts 2, 3, and 4, 2008.

Section 3001.3is hereby deleted in its entirety and substituting in lieu thereof the following:
3001.3 Accessibility. Passenger elevators shall conform to the requirements of the State of |llinois
Accessibility Code.

£92)Section 3002.4 is amended by deleting the word "four or more stories above grade plane or four or more
stories below grade plane” and by substituting in lieu thereof the following:

"three or more stories, including stories below grade’

Section 3109.1 is amended by deleting the samein its entirety and substituting in lieu thereof the following:
3109.1 General. Swimming pools shall comply with the al applicable sections of this code, the
Municipal Code and the State of |llinois Swimming Pool Code.

Section 3109.5.1 is amended by deleting the same in its entirety and substituting in lieu thereof the following:
3109.5.1 Suction fittings. All pool and spa suction outlets shall be provided with a cover that
conformsto ASME A112.19 8M-2007 on every drain/gate.

Page 25 of 29



2006 IBC Code

CHAPTER 32
{9A-Chapter 32 isamended by deleting the same in its entirety.

CHAPTER 33

Section 3305 lis amended bv deletl ng the samein its entl rety and substltutl ng.in lieu thereof the following:

3305.1 Facilitiesrequired. Sanitary facilities shall be provided during construction, remodeling, or
demolition activities in accordance with the Municipal Code and the State of 11linois Plumbing Code.

Section 3306.1 is amended by deleting the samein its entirety and substituting in lieu thereof the following:
3306.1 Protection required. Pedestrians shall be protected during construction, remodeling, and
demolition activities as required by this chapter and Section 7.11.1 of the Municipal Code.

Section 3306.2 is amended by deleting the samein its entirety and substituting in lieu thereof the following:

3306.2 Walkways. A wakway shall be provided for pedestrian travel in front of every construction
and demolition site unless permission has been granted for the sidewalk to be fenced or closed. Walkways
shall be of sufficient width to accommodate the pedestrian traffic, provide adurable walking surface, and
shall be designed to support all imposed loads.

Section 3306.6 is amended by deleting the samein its entirety and substituting in lieu thereof the following:
3306.6 Barrier design. Barriers shall be designed to resist |oads required in Chapter 16.

Section 3306.7 is amended by deleting the exceptions and conditions and substituting in lieu thereof the
following:

Exception:
Roofs and supporting structures of covered walkways for new, light-frame construction not exceeding two

storiesin height are permitted to be designed for alive load of 75 psf or the loadsimposed on them,
whichever is greater.

Section 3311 and its subsections are amended by deleting the samein its entirety and substituting in lieu
thereof the following:

3311 Standpipes. For requirements during construction, the provisions of the International Fire
Code shall apply.

CHAPTER 34

{99)-Section 3401 3is amended by deleting the same |n its entlretv and substituti ng |n I|eu thereof the
foIIowmg i

3401.3. Compliance with other codes. Alterations, repairs, additions and changes of occupancy to
existing structures shall comply with the provisions for aterations, repairs, additions and changes of
occupancy in the International Fire Code, International Fuel Gas Code, |nternational Mechanical Code, State
of Illinois Plumbing Code, International Property Maintenance Code, and the National Electrical Code.

Page 26 of 29



2006 IBC Code

Section 3402.1 is amended by deleting the words "and which are necessary to provide accessihility" from the
last sentence of the paragraph for the definition of Technicaly Infeasible.

Section 3403.1 is amended by adding the following exception:
Exception:
The provisions of the codes listed in Section 3401.3 shall apply.

Section 3403.1.1 is amended by deleting the words "in Section 1612.3" and substituting in lieu thereof the
words:
"by local flooding data'".

Section 3403.2.1 isdeleted in its entirety.

Section 3403.2.2 isdeleted in its entirety.

Section 3403.2.3.1 shall be amended by deleting Condition 2 and Condition 3 in their entirety.

Section 3403.3 is amended by adding the following at the end of the first paragraph:
"and meet the requirements of all sections of this code and those listed in Section 3401.3"

Section 3404.1.3 through Section 3404.4 are deleted in their entirety.

Section 3406.1 is amended by deleting the |ast sentence of the paragraph and substituting in lieu thereof the
following:

" Subject to the approva of the building official, the use or occupancy of existing buildings shall be
permitted to be changed and the building is allowed to be occupied for purposes in other use groups. The
provisions of this code and all codes listed in Section 3401.3 shall apply."

Section 3407.2 isdeleted in its entirety.

Section 3408.1 is amended by adding the following at the end of the first paragraph:
"for those portions of the structure that are new or rebuilt."

Section 3409 isddeted in its entirety and substituting in lieu thereof the following:
3409 Accessibility for existing buildings. The provisions of the State of I1linois Accessibility Code

shall apply.

Section 3410 isdeleted in its entirety.

Page 27 of 29



2006 IBC Code

APPENDIX H

Section H 101.1 is amended by deleting the samein its entirety and substituting in lieu thereof the following:
H 101.1 General. For any provisions not covered by this code the provisions of Chapter 28, Article
XV of the Municipa Code shall apply.

Section H 101.2 isdeleted in its entirety.

Section H 102 isdeleted in its entirety.

Section H 106.1 is amended by deleting the words "1CC Electrical Code" and substituting in lieu thereof the

following:
"National Electrical Code as adopted and amended by the Village"

Section H 106.2 is amended by deleting the words "1CC Electrical Code" and subgtituting in lieu thereof the

following:
"National Electrica Code as adopted and amended by the Village"

Section H 108 through Section H 110 are deleted in their entirety.

Section H 112.1 is amended by deleting the following words from the first sentence:
"constructed entirely of metal or other noncombustible material and"

Section H 112.4 isdeleted in its entirety.

Section H 114 isdeleted in its entirety.

Section H 115 is amended by deleting the words "I CC Electrical Code" and substituting in lieu thereof the

following:
"National Electrical Code as adopted and amended by the Village"

APPENDIX |

Section 1101.1.1 is hereby added asfollows:
1101.1.1 Construction Standards. Patio covers shall be constructed of materias and installations
as approved by the provisions of this code.

(Ord. No. 1281, § 15; Ord. No. 1370, § 1; Ord. No. 1586, 88 2, 3, 6; Ord. No. 1747, § 1; Ord. No. 1846, § 1,
Ord. No, 2020, § 1; Ord. No. 2089, 88 1, 2; Ord. No. 2116, § 2; Ord. No. 2122, 8§ 1; Ord. No. 2143, § 4; Ord.
No, 2151, 88 1, 2; Ord. No. 2208, § 1; Ord. No. 2209, § 1; Ord. No. 2397, § 1; Ord. No. 2547, § 2; Ord. No.
2563, 8 1; Ord. No. 2584, § 3; Ord. No. 2608, § 2; Ord. No. 2709, § 1; Ord. No. 2768, &1; Ord. No. 2857, §
3; Ord. No. 3118, § 2; Ord. No. 3184, § 3; Ord. No. 3193, § 1; Ord. No. 3391, § 3.

Section 3. That al ordinances or parts of ordinancesin conflict with the provisions of this ordinance are

hereby repealed.

Section 4. That this ordinance shall bein full force and effect November 6, 2009.
Page 28 of 29



2006 IBC Code

Mayor

Passed:
Published:
Attest:

Village Clerk

Page 29 of 29



	  Item ORD 00-03895 
	Village of Downers Grove 
	Report for the Village Council Workshop 
	October 6, 2009 Agenda 


	Manager Memo - Building Codes.pdf
	  Item ORD 00-03895 
	Village of Downers Grove 
	Report for the Village Council Workshop 
	October 6, 2009 Agenda 






