ITEM
VILLAGE OF DOWNERS GROVE
REPORT FOR THE VILLAGE CouNcIL WORKSHOP
DECEMBER 8™, 2009 AGENDA

SUBJECT: TYPE: SUBMITTED BY:
Resolution
Ordinance
v Motion Robert Porter
Bid: Police Uniform & Equipment Discussion Only | Chief of Police
SYNOPSIS

Motions are requested to approve a police equipment and police uniform contract with Ray O’Herron
Company, Inc. of Lombard, Illinois. The contracts will be effective from January 1, 2010 to December
31, 2010.

STRATEGIC PLAN ALIGNMENT

The Five Year Plan and Goals for 2007-2012 identified Exceptional Municipal Organization. A
supporting objective of this goal is Top Quality Core Services Responsive to Current and Future
Community and Residents Needs.

FIScAL IMPACT
The adopted FY10 budget provides $102,746 in the General Fund for this expenditure.

RECOMMENDATION
Approval on the December 8, 2009 consent agenda.

BACKGROUND

The proposed contracts would specify a vendor for police uniform and equipment purchases for a one-year
period. Terms of the Collective Bargaining Agreement allow officers to purchase clothing or equipment
at the fixed price established by the vendor with billing direct to the officer. Police Department uniforms
may be purchased five ways: direct contract purchase, indirect contract purchase (as provided in the union
contract), individual purchase of civilian clothing/equipment, other specialty items purchase and state tag-
along contract purchase.

An official Request for Proposal process was conducted for police uniform and equipment. Ray O’Herron
Co., Inc. was the only company to submit a bid on the equipment contract. Ray O’Herron Co., Inc. and
Kale Uniforms of Wheaton, IL submitted bids on the uniform products. After reviewing the two bids and
analyzing the price quotes on the most frequently purchased items by the police department, Ray
O’Herron Co., Inc. offered the lowest overall bid.

ATTACHMENTS

Contract Form — Equipment Contract
Contract Form — Uniform Contract
Uniform Contract Bid Tabulation Sheet



Village of Downers Grove

ORDER PLACEMENT & DELIVERY

The intent of this bid is to identify a dependable supplier of police department uniforms for the
Downers Grove Police Department delivered within a reasonable time period, as noted below.

The Police Department requires delivery of items no later than fourteen (14) days after receipt of
order.

Delivery shall be F.0Q.B. Downers Grove Police Department within fourteen (14) days of order
placement. If an order is outstanding after thirty days (30) the contractor will compensate the
Village by:

Crediting or Refunding the Village or Officer 10% of the total cost of the original order.

Individuals picking up orders from the supplier must present proper authorization in the form of
badge presentation and proper Village Purchase Order number.

SPECIAL TAILORING AND OVERSIZE ORDERS

Please state the charge or percent of purchase price for special tailoring and oversize orders.

COMPLIANCE

Bidders shall indicate price for compliance. Bidders may note attachments, if necessary, below
each item number. If no entry is made, the Village will assume that the bidder cannot meet
Village specifications for that item.

Materials to be furnished for the Police Department:

ITEM DESCRIPTION PRICE & VENDOR ITEM #

BELTS - Estimated Quantity of 15 Each Style

‘1. Sam Browne Belt:
Basket Weave, Leather w/o Buckle

a. Bianchi 1a.No Bid Your #
b. Safariland 1b.555.00 Your# 94

2. Sam Browne Belt:
Basket Weave, Leather w/Buckle

a. Bianchi 2a.No Bid Your#
b. Safariland 2b. $29.00 Your# 99-X-4
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3. Garrison Belt:
Basket Weave, Leather

a. Bianchi 3a. No Bid Your #
b. Safariland 3b. $26.00 Your #51-X-4
¢. Boston : 3c. _$23.50 Your # 5023

MISCELLANEOUS - Estimated Quantity of 15 Each Item

4. Belt Keepers:
Black Basket Weave, Velcro or Snap 4, $10.95  Your# 65-4-4
# of Keepers Per Package __ 4

5. Leather Microphone Strap: 5. _41.95 Your# 5467
Velcro or Snap (Silver or Gold) feature,
Black, White

6. Hand Cuffs: 6. _$21.95 Your#_350103

Welded Chain, Stainless Steel

7. Hand Cuff Case: 7. 528.95  Your# 90-4
Basket Weave, Open Top or Snap Closure

8. Wooden Straight Baton: 8. $11.95  Your# 2801
Monadnock Black Hickory 26”

9. Baton Ring: 9. 87.95 Your# 67
10. Armament System Collapsible Baton (ASP)
Black Chrome
a. 21” Baton 10a, $68.00 Your #32%11
b. 26” Baton 10b.872.50 Your #52611
11. ASP Holder: 11. _%28.50 Your # 324
Basket Weave
12. Key Ring: 12. $15.95 Your #168-4

Basket Weave, Double Snap

13. Mace:
18% Oleoresin Capsicum Solution
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a. 3.0 Ounce
b. 1.47 Ounce

14, Mace Canister Holder:
a. 1.47 Oz., Black Basket Weave, Closed
Snap (Silver or Gold) Top
b. 3.0 Oz., Black Basket Weave, Closed
Snap (Silver or Gold) Top

15. Latex Glove Pouch:
Basket Weave

16. Security Holster:

a. Safariland Level 11
b. Safariland Level Il

17. Magazine Holder:
Basket Weave

a. Open Top
b. Snap Top

18. Premier Riot Helmet:
W/Chin Cup and Nap Pad
19. TK390 Radio Holder:

Basket Weave

a. Standard
b. Swivel
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13a. §11.95 Your # 52H2010
13b. §13.95 Your # 5202030
14a. $78.95 Your# 354
14b, $28-95  Your#38-4
15, $8.95 Your# 5640-3
16a. $124.00 Your # 6280

16b. 8124 .00 Your# gogn.g

17a. $20.95 Your # 75
17b. 833.00 Your # 77

18. $99.00  Your# 9006
19a. 521.00 Your #5487-3
19b. $35.95 Your #762




ITEM DESCRIPTION

1. Sam Browne Belt

2. Sam Brown Belt

3. Garrison Belt

4. Belt Keepers

5. Microphone Strap

6. Hand Cuffs

7. Hand Cuff Case

8. Wooden Straight Baton
9. Baton Ring

10. Collapsible Baton (ASP)

11. ASP Holder
12. Key Ring

13. Mace

14. Mace Holder

15. Latex Glove Pouch

16. Security Holster

17. Magazine Holder

Village of Downers Grove

MANUF. PRODUCT # UNIT PRICE
la. a.

1b. 94 1b. $55.00
2a. 2a,

2b. _99-x-4 2b. 329,00
3a, 3a.

3b.  51-X-4 3b. 826.00
3c. 6502-3 3c. $23.50
4. 65-4-4 4. 10,95
5. 5467 5. §7.95

6. 350103 6. 521.95

7. 90-4 7. 28.95

8. 2801: 8.____&1_1__95___
9. 67 9 §7.95
10a. 52411 102.$68. 00
10b. 52611 10b.872.50
11. 32A 11. $28.50
12. 168-4 12. g15.95
13a. 52182010 13a.

13b. 52H2030 13bs13.95
14a. 38-4 14a.528.95
14b. 38-4 14b$28.95
15. _5640-3 15.38.95
16a. 6280 162.3124.00
16b. 6280-5 16b$124.00
17a. 75 17ag20 95
17b. 77 17bs33.00
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18. Riot Helmet 18. 9006 18. $99.00
19. Radio Holder 19a, 54873 192,$21.00
19b. 762 19b.535.95
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IV. BID/CONTRACT FORM

***THIS BID WHEN ACCEPTED AND SIGNED BY AN AUTHORIZED SIGNATORY
OF THE VILLAGE OF DOWNERS GROVE SHALL BECOME A CONTRACT

BINDING UPON BOTH PARTIES.

Entire Block Must Be Completed When A Submitted Bid Is To Be Considered For Award

BIDDER:

Ray O'Herron Co., Inc.
Company Name

3549 N. Vermilion St.
Street Address of Company

Danville, IL 61832
City, State, Zip

800-223-2097
Business Phone

888-223-3235
Fax

Date: November 2. 2009

rayoherron@oherron.com

Email Address

Dan Yara
Contact Name (Print)

800-223-2097
24-Hour Telephone

4 O e,

Signatfire of Officer, Partner or
Sole Proprietor

Ray O'Herrom, President

Print Name & Title
ATTEST: If a Corporatio :
7 : :
2l e IS e
Signature of Corpdfation S€erétary
VILLAGE OF DOWNERS GROVE:
ATTEST:

Authorized Signature

Title

Date

Signature of Village Clerk

Date

In compliance with the specifications, the above-signed offers and agrees, if this Bid is accepted
within 90 calendar days from the date of opening, to furnish any or all of the services upon which
prices are quoted, at the price set opposite each item, delivered at the designated point within the

time specified above.
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CAMPAIGN DISCLOSURE CERTIFICATE
Campaign Disclosure Certificate - |

Any contractor, proposer, bidder or vendor who responds by submitting a bid or proposal to the
Village of Downers Grove shall be required to submit with its bid submission, an executed
Campaign Disclosure Certificate, attached hereto.

The Campaign Disclosure Certificate is required pursuant to the Village of Downers Grove
Council Policy on Ethical Standards and is applicable to those campaign contributions made to
any member of the Village Council.

Said Campaign Disclosure Certificate requires any individual or entity bidding to disclose
campaign contributions, as defined in Section 9-1.4 of the Election Code (10 ILCS 5/9-1.4),
made to current members of the Village Council within the five (5) year period preceding the
date of the bid or proposal release.

By signing the bid documents, contractor/proposer/bidder/vendor agrees to refrain from making
any campaign contributions as defined in Section 9-1.4 of the Election Code (10 ILCS 5/9-1.4) to
any Village Council member and any challengers seeking to serve as a member of the Downers

Grove Village Council.

Under penalty of perjury, I declare:

@ Bidder/vendor has not contributed to any elected Village position within

the last five (5) years.
%‘/0/% Ray O'Herron
Sfenature Print Name

Q Bidder/vendor has contributed a campaign contribution to a current
member of the Village Council within the last five (5) years.

Print the following information:
Name of Contributor:

(company or individual)

To whom contribution was made;

Year contribution made: Amount: $

Signature Print Name

3:H:\My Documentstemplates\Call for Bids\Call for Bids 2008.doc
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Village of Downers Grove

ORDER PLACEMENT & DELIVERY

The intent of this bid is to identify a dependable supplier of police department uniforms for the
Downers Grove Police Department delivered within a reasonable time period, as noted below.

The Police Department requires delivery of items no later than fourteen (14) days after receipt of
order.

Delivery shall be F.O.B. Downers Grove Police Department within fourteen (14) days of order
placement. If an order is outstanding after thirty days (30) the contractor will compensate the
Village by:

Crediting or refunding the Village or Officer 10% of the total cost of the original order.

Individuals picking up orders from the supplier must present proper authorization in the form of
badge presentation and proper Village Purchase Order number.

SPECIAL TAILORING AND OVERSIZE ORDERS
Please state the charge or percent of purchase price for special tailoring and oversize orders.

COMPLIANCE

Bidders shall indicate price for compliance. Bidders may note attachments, if necessary, below
each item number. If no entry is made, the Village will assume that the bidder cannot meet
Village specifications for that item,

Materials to be furnished for the Police Department:

ITEM DESCRIPTION PRICE & VENDOR ITEM #

HATS - Estimated Quantity 10 Each Style

1. Trooper-Style Fur Cap: 1._%19.50  Your# 395
Insulated Quilted Lining
Navy Blue

2. 5-Star Cap: 2. $39.50  Your # SSWNV__
Silver or Gold Cap Strap
Navy Blue

3. Watch Cap: 3. $10.95  your# 125-BLK

Black
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SHIRTS - Estimated Quantity 25 Each Style

4, Flying Cross Shirts: 4, $33.50  yoyur# 3314 S/s
Permanent Press, Backed-in Military ~ $35.95 314 L/S
Creases, Pleated Pockets w/Velcro
Fasteners, Epaulets, Long and Short
Sleeves, Men’s and Women’s Sizes,

Service Bars Optional on Long Sleeve
Shirts, Navy Blue, Light Blue, White

5. Flying Cross Poly Rayon Lycra Uniforms: 5, $46.50 Your # 95R6986 5/5
Permanent Press, Backed-in Military  $52.00 45W6986 L/S
Creases, Pleated Pockets w/Velcro
Fasteners, Epaulets, Long and Short
Sleeves, Men’s and Women’s Sizes,

Service Bars Optional on Long Sleeve

Shirts, Navy Blue, White

6. Elbeco Tex-Trop Duty Shirts: 6. §33.50 Your # 3310-S/S Wht
Permanent Press, Backed-in Military $35.95 310 -L/S Wht
Creases, Pleated Pockets w/Velcro $33.50 3314-S/s NB
Fasteners, Epaulets, L d Short 73395 314 -L/S NB

» CPAUTELs, LOng and 51o $33.50 3313-S/S LB

Sleeves, Men’s and Women’s Sizes, $35.95 313 -L/S LB
Service Bars Optional on Long Sleeve
Shirts, Navy Blue, Light Blue, White

7. Elbeco Paragon Plus Shirts: 7. $26.50 Your #_P868 5/8
Permanent Press, Backed-in Military $30.50 P878 L/S
Creases, Pleated Pockets w/Velcro
Fasteners, Epaulets, Long and Short
Sleeves, Men’s and Women'’s Sizes,
Service Bars Optional on Long Sleeve
Shirts, Light Blue

8. Perfection Uniform Shirts: 8.841.50 Your #_3345DN S/8§
65% Polyester/35% Rayon, Long and $45.50 o 3045DN L/s
Short Sleeves, Men’s and Women'’s $40.50 8900DN S/S
Sizes, Service Bars Optional on Long $46.50 8910DN L/S
Sleeve Shirts, Dark Navy, White,
(Chicago) Blue

9. Perfection Uniform Shirts: ' 9.$34.50 Your # 2340pN 5/g
100% Polyester, Long and Short Sleeves, $41.95 2040DN L/S

Men’s and Women's Sizes, Service Bars
Optional on Long Sleeve Shirts, Dark
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Navy, White, (Chicago) Blue

TURTLENECKS - Estimated Quantity 12 Each Style

10. Elbeco Regulation Turtleneck: 10.

12" DGPD Embroidered on Collar,
Off Center to the Left, White, Gold

11. Blauer Stretch Turtleneck: 11,

5 DGPD Embroidered on Collar,
Off Center to the Left, White, Gold

12. Interlock/East Valley Apparel Turtleneck: 12.

50% Polyester/50% Cotton,
¥” DGPD Embroidered on Collar,
Off Center to Left, White, Gold

13. Made in the USA Mock Turtleneck Dickies 13.

15 DGPD Embroidered on Collar,
Off Center to the Left, White, Gold

14. Interlock/East Valley Apparel Mock 14.

Turtleneck:

50% Polyester/50% Cotton

¥%* DGPD Embroidered on Collar,
Off Center to the Left, White, Gold

15. Mock Turtleneck: 1.

¥,” DGPD Embroidered on Collar,
Off Center to the Left, White, Gold

PANTS — Estimated Quantity 25 Each Style

16. 80% Polyester/20% Wool
(To be matched to the Flying Cross
Shirt), Male and Female Size and
Style, Navy Blue

$24.50

$32.95

No Bid

$14.50

No Bid

$32.95

a. Quarter Top: 162.250.50

b. Western Pockets: 165550. 50

17. 75% Polyester/25% Wool
(To be Matched to the Elbeco Shirt),
Male and Female Size and Style,
Navy Blue
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Your # 7700

Your# 8100X

Your #

Your # 8119X

Your #

Your # 8110

Your # 32222
Your # 322220uT
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a. Quarter Top:
b. Western Pockets

18. 100% Textured Dacron Polyester Knit:
Wash and Wear, No Stripe, Flare Bottom,
No Cuff, Male and Female Size and

Style, Navy Blue

a. Quarter Top:
b. Western Pockets:

19. Flying Cross #38200

(To Match Flying Cross Dress Blouse)

Navy

20. Newport Harbor Dress Pants:

(To Match Newport Harbor Dress Blouse)

Navy

21. Perfection Polyester Gabardine:
100% Visa Polyester, 11 Oz.

Gabardine Weave, Quarter Top Pockets,

Dark Navy

22, Perfection Polyester/Rayon/Lycra
Cargo Pocket:

70% Polyester, 28% Rayon, 2%
Lycra, 12 %2 - 12 % Oz. Serge Weave,
Quarter Top Pockets, Dark Navy

23. Perfection Polyester/Rayon:

70% Polyester, 28% Rayon, 2% Lycra,
12 Y - 12 % Oz. Serge Weave, Quarter

Top Pockets, Dark Navy

24, Perfection Cargo Shorts:

Male and Female Sizes and Style

Dark Navy

25. Blauer Streetgear Shorts

Male and Female Sizes and Style

Navy Blue, Black

TIE - Estimated Quantity 3 Each Style

17a. $55.95 Your # 42280
175. Your #

18a. $33.50  Your# Hs2i49
18b. $35.00  Your # HS215B

19. $32.95 Your# 38200

20. No Bid  Your#

21. $32.95 Your # 2600DN

$57.00 or 8980-NB
22, $72.00 Your# 3775DN

$50.00 or 8950
23._$55.00 Your#_ 3725DN

24, 946.00 yourg 1785DN

25. $46.00 Your# 8841-1%
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26. Clip-on Style

Metal Catch w/Buttonhole, Navy Blue

27. Cross-over Style
Navy Blue

$4.50 " 45045NB

26. Your

27. 56.95 Your# 4505NB-Ct

OUTERWEAR - Estimated Quantity 15 Each Style

28. Leather Jacket
Chicago-Style, Navy, Black

29. Blauer 9010Z Gore-Tex Cruiser Jacket
Navy

30. Blauer TNT Series Light Weight Jacket
Navy

31. Spiewak Heavy Three Season Coat:
Zip Out Lining, Navy

32. Spiewak Light Three Season Coat:
Zip Out Lining, Navy

33. Blauer Sweater:
Embroidered Patch on Left Breast,
Patches on Sleeves, Navy

a, #205 Without Liner
b. #205XER With Liner

34. Cobmex Commando Sweater:
Embroidered Patch on Left Breast,
Patches on Sleeves, Navy

35. Cobmex Jersey Knit V-Neck Sweater:
Embroidered Patch on Left Breast,
Patches on Sleeves, Navy

a. #2026 Without Liner
b. #2805 With Liner

36. Cobmex Hershey Knit Crew Neck
Zip Front Sweater:
Embroidered Patch on Left Breast,

25

28. $235.00  Your# _gi4sg

29. $265.00 Your# 9010z-NB
30. $107.00 Your# 6110-NB

31. $275.00  Your# SH3465-11
32. $119.00  Your# 8310

33a. §59.00 Your #205-NR__
33b.5119.00 Your #205XCR~NB

34. $46.00 _ Your# 8082-4019
35a.$41.50 Your# 2026-4019
35b.5105.00 Your # 2805-4019
36. $43.00 Your # 4012-4019
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Patches on Sleeves, Navy

37. Flying Cross Dress Blouse:
#38800 Lined Coat Navy

38. Newport Harbor Dress Blouse:
39. Reversible Raincoat:

a. Black/Orange, Reversible Twill

b. Black/Fluorescent Yellow, Reversible
Twill

Estimated Quantity of 10

40. Cap Cover:
Black Nylon
Estimated Quantity of 10

41. Scarf:
Synthetic Blend, Navy
Estimated Quantity of 5

42, Gloves:

a. 2 in 1 Wool Insert Glove
Black Leather w/Removable
Wool Liner

b. Insulated Ski Glove
Fine Grain Leather, Full Cut
W/Plainn Back

43, CALEA Logo Name Tags:
a. Brushed Silver or Gold
b. Polished Silver or Gold
Estimated Quantity of 15

44. Serving Since Pins: =

a. Brushed Silver or Gold
b. Polished Silver or Gold
Estimated Quantity of 5
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39z, $52.00 Your #447RSC
39b. $76.00 Your # 26999

40, $4.50 Your# 101-BIK
41, $9.00 Your #5C16

42 No Bid Your #
42b.$27.007 Your # NS4301
433.817.95 Your #J3W/AB408

43b.517.95 Your #Izm_agzgg

444.$10.95
44b$10.95

Your # J6
Your # 34
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45. Boots:

Men’s and Women's Sizes
a. 8” Rocky Eliminator Boot 45a. $134.00  Your # 8021-1
b. Rocky 911 Series 8” Boot 45b. Your # Discontinued
¢. Thorogood Code 3 Enforcer Boot 45c, Your # Discontinued
d. Original SWAT Black Classic 6” 45d. $60.95 Your # 1151
e. Original SWAT Black Classic 6™

Side Zip 45e. Your # Discontigued
f. Original SWAT Black Classic 9” 45f $63.00 Your # 1150
g. Original SWAT Black Classic 9”

Side Zip 45g. $66.50 Your #1152
h. Original SWAT Black Classic 10” 45h. Your # Discontinued
i. Original SWAT Black Classic 6”

Leather Waterproof Steel Toe 451, Your # Discontinued
J. Original SWAT Black 9” Tactical

Waterproof 45j. $65.95 Your# 1270

k. Original SWAT Black Classic 9”
Leather Waterproof Insulated

Side Zip 45k, $77.00 Your #1234
1. Original SWAT Black Classic 9”

Leather Waterproof Insulated 45). 349 95 Your # 1010
Estimated Quantity of 25 Various Styles

46, Shoes: ,

Men’s and Women’s Sizes
a. Bates Corfam 46a. $79.00 Your # g42
b. Thorogood Leather Black Shoe 46b. $89.00 Your# 932
¢. Black Forward Thrust Shoe 46¢. Your # Discontinued
d. Black Code 3 Shoe 46d. Your # Discontinued
e, Black Gym Style Shoe 46e. Your # Discontinued
f. Black High Top Style Gym Shoe 46f. Your # Discontinued
g. Insulated Waterproof Boot 46g.$134.00 Your # 8032-1
h. Black Leather Walking Shoe 46h. Your # Discontinued
i. Leather Lightweight Shoe 461. Your # piscontinued
j. Original SWAT Dress Oxford 46j. §39.00 Your #1180
k. Original SWAT All Leather Oxford 46k, Your # Discontinued

Estimated Quantity of 20 Various Styles
47. Police Patches:
Vendor Supplied

Price Per Patch 47,
# of Patches per Loom
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ITEM DESCRIPTION MANUF. PRODUCT # UNIT PRICE
1. Trooper-Style Fur Cap 1. 195 I. _$19.50
2. 5-Star Cap 2. _5SWNV - 2._s39 59
3. Watch Cap 3. _125-BIK 3. 510.95
3314 - §/5 $33.50
4. Flying Cross Shirts 4, 314 - 1/s 4. _$35.95
95R6986 $46.50
5.F.C. Poly/Rayon/Lycra 5. 45W6986 5._%52. 00
6. Elbeco Tex-Trop Shirts 6. _gee Page 22 6.
pP8es $26.50
7. Elbeco Paragon Plus 7. P878 7. _%30.50
8. Perfection 65% Poly 8, _°°¢ page 22 8.
9. Perfection 100% Poly 9. _See page 22 9.
10. Elbeco Regulation
T-Neck 10. 7700 10. 524.50
11. Blauer Stretch T-Neck  11. 8100% 11. $32.95
12. Interlock/East Valley
Apparel T-Neck 12. 12, yo pia
13. Made in the USA Mock 13, 8119X 13. $14.50
14. Interlock/East Valley
Apparel Mock
Turtleneck 14. 14. 5o Rig
15. Mock Turtleneck 15.8110 15, $32.95
16. 80%-20% Pants 16232222 112850.50
16b322220uT 11b$50.50
17. 75%-25% Pants 17a. 42280 12a. $55.95
17b. 12b.No Bid
18. 100% Poly Knit Pants ~ 18a. HS2149 13a. $33.50
18b. HS2158 13b.§35 .00
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19. F.C. #38200 Pants
ITEM DESCRIPTION

20. Newport Harbor Dress
Pants

21. Perfection Polyester
Gabardine Pants

22. Perfection Poly/Rayon/
Lycra Cargo Pocket
Pants

23. Perfection Poly/Rayon

24. Perfection Cargo Shorts

25. Blauer Sneetgear Shorts

26. Clip-on Tie

27. Cross-over Tie

28. Leather Jacket

29. Blauer 9010 Jacket

30. Blauer TNT Jacket

31. Spiewak Heavy
3-Season Coat

32. Spiewak Light
3-Season Coat

33. Blauer Sweater

34, Cobmex Commando
Sweater

19.
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38200

MANUF. PRODUCT #

20.

21. __2600Dn
8980-NB

22, 3775DN
8950

23. 3725DN

24. 1785DN

25. 8841~1X

26. 4504JNB

27.  45045NB-CT

28, G450

29, 9010-NB

30. 6110-NB

31. SH3465-11

32. 8310

33a. 205-NB

33b. 205%cR-uE

34. 8082-4019

29

19. $32.95

UNIT PRICE

20. No Bid

21. _332.95

$57.00
22, $72.00

$50.00
23. _355.00

24. $46.00

25. $46.00

28. $235.00
29. $265.00

30. $107.00

31. 8275,
32. $119.00
33a.359.00

33b.$119.00

34, 346.00




35. Cobmex Jersey Knit
V-Neck Sweater

ITEM DESCRIPTION

36. Cobmex Hershey Knit
Crew Neck Sweater

37. F.C. Dress Blouse
38. N.H. Dress Blouse

39, Reversible Raincoat

40. Cap Cover
41. Scarf

42. Gloves

43, CALEA Name Tags

44, Serving Since Pins

45, Boots

46. Shoes

Village of Downers Grove

354, 2026-4019

35b. 2805-4019

MANUF. PRODUCT #

36. 4012-4019

37. 38200
38.

39a. 447RSC
39b. 26000
40. 101-BLK
41, 8Cl6
42a.

42b, NS430C

43a_J3W/A8408

43b, J2W/AB408

443, J6

44p. J6

45a, 8021-1

45b.

45¢.

45d. 1151

45e.

45f. 1150

45g. 1152

45h.

45i.

45§, 1270

45k. 1234

45]. 1010

46a. 942

30

35a.841.50
35b.5105.00

UNIT PRICE

-

36. $43.00
37. $129.00

No Bi
38. o Bid

3%a.452.00
39h.876.00

40. 84.50
41, $9.00
42aNo Bid
42b.$27.00
432817.95
43bg27.95

44a, $10.95
44b. $10.95

455, $134.00

45b. Discontinued
45c, Discontinued

45d. 860,95

45e. Discontinued

45f $63.00
45g. $66.50

45h, Discontinued
45i, Discontinued -

45;. $65.95
45k. $72.00
451, $49.905

46a. $79.00
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46b. 932 46b. $89.00
46c. 46¢c. Discontinued
46d. 46d. piscontinued
46e. 46e. Discontinued
46%, 46f Discontinued
46g. 8032-1 46g. 5134.00
46h. 46h. Discontinued
ITEM DESCRIPTION MANUF. PRODUCT # UNIT PRICE
46. Shoes 461, : 46i. Discontinued
46j. 1180 46j. $39.00
46k. 46k. Discontinued
47. Police Patches 47. 47. S1.85

Minimum of 1000

31




V. BID/CONTRACT FORM
**THIS BID WHEN ACCEPTED AND SIGNED BY AN AUTHORIZED SIGNATORY

OF THE VILLAGE OF DOWNERS GROVE SHALL BECOME A CONTRACT
BINDING UPON BOTH PARTIES.

Entire Block Must Be Completed When A Submitted Bid Is To Be Considered For Award

BIDDER:

Ray O'Herron Co., Inc. Date: November 2, 2009
Company Name

rayoherron@oherron.com

3549 N. Vermilion St. Email Address
Street Address of Company
Dan Yara
Danville, IL 61832 Contact Name (Print)

City, State, Zip 800-223-2097

800-223-2097 24-Hour Telephone
Business Phone i/
@ ‘ i Oﬂé\ﬁ//(’ (’h’l
888-223-3235 Signatufre of Officer, Partner or
Fax ~ Sole Proprietor

Ray O'Herron, President

Print Name & Title

VILLAGE OF DOWNERS GROVE:
ATTEST:

Authorized Signature

Signature of Village Clerk

Title

Date Date

In compliance with the specifications, the above-signed offers and agrees, if this Bid is accepted
within 90 calendar days from the date of opening, to furnish any or all of the services upon which
prices are quoted, at the price set opposite each item, delivered at the designated point within the

time specified above.

[aN]




Village of Downers Grove

Cflmpmgn Dlsclosure Certmcate

Anw contractor proposer, bldder or vendor who reSponds by submlttmo a bld or proposal to the
Village of Downers Grove shall be required to submit with its bid submission, an executed
Campaign Disclosure Certificate, attached hereto.

The Campaign Disclosure Certificate is required pursuant to the Village of Downers Grove
Council Policy on Ethical Standards and is applicable to those campaign contributions made to

any member of the Village Council.

Said Campaign Disclosure Certificate requires any individual or entity bidding to disclose
campaign contributions, as defined in Section 9-1.4 of the Election Code (10 ILCS 5/9-1.4),
made to current members-of the Village Council within-the five (5) year period preceding the
date of the bid or proposal release.

By signing the bid documents, contractor/proposer/bidder/vendor agrees to refrain from making
any campaign contributions as defined in Section 9-1.4 of the Election Code (10 ILCS 5/9-1.4) to
any Village Council member and any challengers seeking to serve as a member of the Downers

Grove Village Council.

Under penalty of perjury, I declare:

3 Bidder/vendor has not contributed to any elected Village position within
the last five (5) years.
@# 4 )22 Ray 0'Hlerzon

SlUn Print Name

O Bidder/vendor has contributed to an elected Village position within the
last five (5) years.

Print the following information:
Name of Contributor:

(company or individual)

To whom contribution was made:

Year contribution made: Amount: §

Signature Print Name
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Police Department Uniforms - Contract

FY2010

Bid Tabulation: Police Department Uniforms

Kale Uniforms

Ray O'Herron Co., Inc

ITEM # [DESCRIPTION EST. QTY [UNIT $ |EXTENSION
1 Fur Cap 10| 17.95 179.50
2 5-Star Cap 10 4250 425.00
3 Watch Cap 10 3.50 35.00
4 F.C. /s Shirt 25| 47.95 1198.75

F.C. s/s Shirt 25| 43.95 1098.75
5 FC Poly Rayon Lycra l/s 25| 53.95 1348.75

FC Poly Rayon Lycra s/4 25| 47.95 1198.75
6 Elb. Tex-Trop I/s 25| 36.50 912.5

Elb. Tex-Trop s/s 25| 33.95 848.75
7 Elb. Paragon Plus /s 25| 32.50 812.50

Elb. Paragon Plus s/s 25| 29.95 748.75
8 Perfection 65 Polyl/s 25| 30.95 773.75

Perfection 65 Poly s/s 25| 29.95 748.75
9 Perfection 100 Poly I/s 25| 32.95 823.75

Perfection 100 Poly s/s 25| 30.50 762.5
10 Elbeco T-Neck 12| 24.95 299.4
11 Blauer T-Neck 12 32.50 390
12 Interlock T-Neck 12 0.00 0.00
14 Interlock Mock T-Neck 12 0.00 0.00
15 Mock T-Neck 12| 32.50 390.00
16a 80/20 Pants Quarter 25| 44.95 1123.75
17a 75/25 Pants Quarter 25| 49.95 1248.75
17b 75/25 Pants Western 25 0.00 0.00
18a 100 Pant Quarter 25| 29.95 748.75
18b 100 Pant Western 25| 34.50 862.50
19 FC Dress Pant 25| 29.95 748.75
20 NH Dress Pant 25 0.00 0.00
21 Perfection 100 Pant 25| 29.95 748.75
22 Perfection P/R/L Pant 25| 59.95 1498.75
23 Perfection P/R Pant 25| 49.95 1248.75
24 Perfection Cargo Pant 25| 46.95 1173.75
25 Blauer Streetgear Short{ 25| 49.95 1248.75
26 Clip-on Tie 3 4.00 12.00
27 Cross-over Tie 3 3.50 10.50
28 Leather Jacket 15[ 295.00 4425.00
29 Blauer 9010 Jacket 15| 274.95 4124.25
30 Blauer TNT Jacket 15| 125.00 1875.00
31 Spiewak 3-Season Jack 15| 229.95 3449.25
32 Spiewak Lite Coat 15| 99.95 1499.25
33a Blauer Sweater w/o Ling 15| 74.95 1124.25
33b Blauer Sweater w/Liner 15 134.95 2024.25
34 Cobmex Commando Swj 15| 43.00 645.00
35a Cobmex Jersey Sweate 15[ 46.00 690.00
35b Cobmex Jersey Sweate 15| 109.95 1649.25
36 Cobmex Hershey Sweat 15| 46.00 690.00

EST. QTY [UNIT$ |EXTENSION
10] 19.50 195.00
10| 39.50 395.00
10] 10.95 109.50
25| 35.95 898.75
25| 33.50 837.50
25| 52.00 1300.00
25 46.50 1162.50
25| 35.95 898.75
25 33.50 837.50
25| 30.50 762.50
25 26.50 662.50
25| 45.50 1137.5
25 41.50 1037.5
25| 41.95 1048.75
25 34.50 862.5
12| 24.50 294
12) 32.95 395.4
12 0.00 0.00
12 0.00 0.00
12| 32.95 395.40
25 50.50 1262.50
25 55.95 1398.75
25 0.00 0.00
25 33.50 837.50
25 35.00 875.00
25  32.95 823.75
25 0.00 0.00
25 32.95 823.75
25 57.00 1425.00
25 50.00 1250
25 46.00 1150.00
25| 46.00 1150.00

3 4.50 13.50

3 6.95 20.85
15| 235.00 3525.00
15| 265.00 3975.00
15| 107.00 1605.00
15| 275.00 4125.00
15| 119.00 1785.00
15| 59.00 885
15| 119.00 1785.00
15| 46.00 690.00
15 41.50 622.50
15| 105.00 1575.00
15| 43.00 645.00




Kale Uniforms

Ray O'Herron Co., Inc

ITEM # [DESCRIPTION EST. QTY [UNIT $ |EXTENSION
37 FC Dress Blouse 15| 139.95 2099.25
38 NH Dress Blouse 15 0.00 0.00
39a Reversible Raincoat BIk 10| 94.50 945
39b Reversible Raincoat BIk| 10| 94.50 945
40 Cap Cover 10 7.95 79.50
41 Scarf 5 4.00 20.00
42b Insuated Ski Glove 5[ 26.95 134.75
43a CALEA Name Tag Brus 15 12.75 191.25
43b CALEA Name Tag Polis 15| 12.75 191.25
44a Serving Since Brushed 5 8.95 44.75
44b Serving Since Polished 5 8.95 44,75
45a 8" Rocky Eliminator Boo| 25| 136.50 3412.50
45e Original SWAT Classic 25 0.00 0.00
45h Original SWAT Classic 1 25 0.00 0.00
45j Original SWAT 6" Steel 25 0.00 0.00
46a Bates Corfam 20| 78.50 1570.00
46b Thorogood Leather 20| 89.95 1799.00
469 Insulated Waterproof Bo| 20| 116.95 2339.00
46k Original SWAT All Leath 20 0.00 0.00

TOTALS 3351.35 59680.40

Note: Ray O'Herron is the low bidder on overall bid upon items.

EST. QTY [UNIT$ |[EXTENSION
15| 129.00 1935.00
15 0.00 0.00
10| 52.00 520
10|] 76.00 760
10 4.50 45.00

5 9.00 45.00
5[ 27.00 135.00
15) 17.95 269.25
15 17.95 269.25
5] 10.95 54.75
5[ 10.95 54.75
25[ 134.00 3350.00
25 0.00 0.00
25 0.00 0.00
25 0.00 0.00
20[ 79.00 1580.00
20| 89.00 1780.00
20 134.00 2680.00
20 0.00 0.00
3275.30 58956.65




Price Diff |% Diff
1.55 8.64
-3.00| -7.06
7.45| 212.86
-12.00| -25.03
-10.45| -23.78
-1.95| -3.61
-1.45| -3.02
-0.55| -1.51
-0.45| -1.33
-2.00| -6.15
-3.45| -11.52
14.55| 47.01
11.55| 38.56
9.00f 27.31
4,001 13.11
-0.45| -1.80
0.45 1.38
0.00
0.00
0.45 1.38
5.55| 12.35
6.00f 12.01
0.00
3.55[ 11.85
0.50 1.45
3.00] 10.02
0.00
3.00] 10.02
-2.95| -4.92
0.05 0.10
-0.95| -2.02
-3.95| -7.91
0.50f 12.50
3.45| 98.57
-60.00| -20.34
-9.95| -3.62
-18.00| -14.40
45.05( 19.59
19.05| 19.06
-15.95| -21.28
-15.95| -11.82
3.00
-4.50
-4.95

-3.00




-10.95] -7.82
0.00
-42.50] -44.97
-18.50| -19.58
-3.45] -43.40
5.00] 125.00
0.05] 0.19
5.20] 40.78
5.20] 40.78
2.00] 22.35
2.00] 22.35
-2.50] -1.83
0.00
0.00
0.00
0.50] 0.64
-0.95] -1.06
17.05] 14.58
0.00
[ -76.05] -2.27|
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